CITY OF BURIEN, WASHINGTON

ORDINANCE NO. 583

AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY OF BURIEN, WASHINGTON AMENDING
BURIEN MUNICIPAL CODE TITLE 15, (BUILDINGS AND CONSTRUCTION
CODE) BY AMENDING CHAPTERS 15.05 (CONSTRUCTION ADMINISTRATIVE
CODE), 15.10 (CONSTRUCTION CODES), 15.20 (FIRE CODE), PROVIDING FOR
SEVERABILITY, AND ESTABLISHING AN EFFECTIVE DATE.

WHEREAS, Washington statute requires all jurisdictions in the state to adopt by
reference and enforce the updated version of the State Building Code as set forth in RCW
19.27.031; and

WHEREAS, the updated version of the State Building Code will go into effect on July 1,
2013; and

WHEREAS, RCW 19.27.040 permits a city to amend the State Building Code as it applies
within that city, so long as the minimum performance standards for the Code and the
objectives enumerated in RCW 19.27.020 are not diminished; and

WHEREAS, the City Council of the City of Burien has adopted by reference the State
Building Code and related construction codes for the health, safety and welfare of the citizens,
as set forth in the Burien Municipal Code Title 15; and

WHEREAS, the City Council wishes to provide consistency in the administration of the
construction codes; and

WHEREAS, the City Council wishes to provide standards for the maintenance of buildings
and property within the City to protect the public health, safety and welfare;

NOW, THEREFORE, THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF BURIEN, WASHINGTON, DOES
ORDAIN AS FOLLOWS:

Section 1. BMC Chapter 15.05. Chapter 15.05, Construction Administrative Code, of
the Burien Municipal Code is hereby amended by amending various sections as set forth in
Exhibit A.

Section 2. BMC Chapter 15.10. Chapter 15.10, Construction Codes, of the Burien
Municipal Code is hereby amended by amending various sections as set forth in Exhibit B.




Section 3. BMC Chapter 15.20. Chapter 15.20, Fire Code, of the Burien Municipal
Code is hereby amended by amending various sections as set forth in Exhibit C.

Section 4. Severability. Should any section, paragraph, sentence, clause or phrase of
this ordinance, or its application to any person or circumstance, be declared unconstitutional or
otherwise invalid for any reason, or should any portion of this ordinance be pre-empted by state
or federal law or regulation, such decision or pre-emption shall not affect the validity of the
remaining portions of this ordinance or its application to other persons or circumstances.

Section 5. Effective Date. This ordinance shall be published in the official newspaper
of the City, and shall take effect and be in full force beginning July 1, 2013.

ADOPTED BY THE CITY COUNCIL AT A REGULAR MEETING THEREOF ON THE 17" DAY OF
JUNE, 2013, AND SIGNED IN AUTHENTICATION OF ITS PASSAGE THIS 17™" DAY OF JUNE, 2013.

CITY OF BURIEN
Brian Bennett, Mayor

ATTEST/AUTHENTICATED:
/s/ Monica Lusk, City Clerk

Approved as to form:
/s/ Craig D. Knutson, City Attorney

Filed with the City Clerk: May 29, 2013
Passed by the City Council: June 17, 2013
Ordinance No.: 583

Date of Publication: June 20, 2013

Ordinance 583
Page 2 of 2

R:/CC/Ordinances/Ord583 Amend Title 15 Bldg & Const



Exhibit A

Chapter 15.05 CONSTRUCTION ADMINISTRATIVE CODE
Sections:
15.05.010 Short title.
15.05.015 Scope.
15.05.020 Definitions.
15.05.025 Appendices.
15.05.030 Intent.
15.05.035 Referenced codes.
15.05.040 International Building Code - Scope.
15.05.045 International Residential Code - Scope.
15.05.050 International Mechanical Code - Scope.
15.05.055 Liquid Propane Gas Codes - Scope.
15.05.060 International Fuel Gas Code - Scope.
15.05.065 International Fire Code - Scope.
15.05.070 Uniform Plumbing Code - Scope.
15.05.075 Burien Building and Property Maintenance Code - Scope.
15.05.080 International Energy Conservation Code - Scope.
15.05.085 Burien Electrical Code - Scope.
15.05.090 Applicability.
15.05.095 Other laws.
15.05.100 Application of references.
15.05.105 Referenced codes and standards.
15.05.110 Partial invalidity.
15.05.115 Existing structures.
15.05.120 Maintenance.
15.05.125 Added electrical wiring.
15.05.130 Requirements not covered by code.
15.05.135 Moved buildings.
15.05.140 Moved buildings - electrical requirements.
15.05.145 Structures in areas of special flood hazard.
15.05.150 Building department — established.
15.05.155 Building Official designated.
15.05.160 Deputies.
15.05.165 Duties and power of building official.
15.05.170 Applications and permits.
15.05.175 Notices and orders.
15.05.180 Inspections.
15.05.185 Identification.
15.05.190 Right of entry.
15.05.195 Department records.
15.05.200 Liability.
15.05.205 Approved materials and equipment.
15.05.210 Used materials and equipment.
15.05.215 Modifications.



15.05.220 Alternative materials, design and methods of construction and equipment.
15.05.225 Research reports.

15.05.230 Tests.

15.05.235 Permits required.

15.05.240 Electrical permit required.

15.05.245 Work exempt from permit.

15.05.250 Emergency repairs.

15.05.255 Ordinary repairs.

15.05.260 Public service agencies.

15.05.265 Application for permit.

15.05.270 Areas of flood hazard.

15.05.275 Action on permit application.
15.05.280 Time limitation on permit application.
15.05.285 Validity of permit.

15.05.290 Permit expiration.

15.05.295 Permit extensions and renewals.
15.05.300 Permit suspension or revocation.
15.05.305 Placement of permit.

15.05.310 Floor and roof design loads.
15.05.315 Submittal documents.

15.05.320 Construction documents.

15.05.325 Examination of documents.

15.05.330 Use of consultants.

15.05.335 Expedited Plan Review.

15.05.340 Approval of construction documents.
15.05.345 Phased approval.

15.05.350 Design professional in responsible charge.
15.05.355 Deferred submittals.

15.05.360 Amended construction documents.
15.05.365 Retention of construction documents.
15.05.370 Temporary structures and uses.
15.05.375 Fees.

15.05.380 Inspections.

15.05.385 Traffic management systems.
15.05.390 Certificate of occupancy - Use and occupancy.

Page 2 of 46

R:/CC/AAA Ordinances/Ord 583 Bldg & Constr Exhibit A



15.05.395 Service utilities.

15.05.400 Appeals.

15.05.405 Unlawful Acts.

15.05.410 Violations — Penalties.

15.05.415 Stop work order.

15.05.420 Unsafe structures and equipment.
15.05.425 Copies to be available.

15.05.010 Short Title

This chapter shall be known as the Construction Administrative Code of the city of Burien,
hereinafter referred to as “this code.”

15.05.015 Scope.

The provisions of this code shall apply to the administration of the following
construction codes,

(1) International Building Code — Chapter 51-50 WAC;

(2) International Residential Code — Chapter 51-51 WAGC;

(3) International Mechanical Code — Chapter 51-52 WAC;

(4) National Fuel Gas Code (NFPA 54) — Chapter 51-52 WAC;

(5) Liquefied Petroleum Gas Code (NFPA 58) — Chapter 51-52 WAC;

(6) International Fuel Gas Code — Chapter 51-52 WAC;

(7) Uniform Plumbing Code — Chapter 51 —56;

(8) International Energy Conservation Code — Chapter 51-11R, C, and A WAC;

(9) International Existing Building Code — Chapter 51-50-4800000 except that Chapter 1
part 1is retained;

(10)  Burien Electrical Code

15.05.020 Definitions.

For the purpose of this code, certain terms, phrases, words and their derivatives shall
have the meanings set forth in this section. Where terms are not defined, they shall have their
ordinary accepted meanings within the context with which they are used. Webster’s Third
International Dictionary of the English Language, Unabridged latest edition, shall be considered
as providing ordinary accepted meanings. Words used in the singular include the plural and the
plural the singular. Words used in the masculine gender include the feminine and the feminine
the masculine.

Page 3 of 46

R:/CC/AAA Ordinances/Ord 583 Bldg & Constr Exhibit A



“Action” means a specific response complying fully with a specific request by the city.

“Amended construction documents” means changes or revisions to the approved plans which
do not alter the size, shape, height, location or orientation on property, major components of
the structural load path, or exiting requirements.

“BMC” means the Burien Municipal Code.

“BPMC” means the Burien Building and Property Maintenance Code as adopted by the city of
Burien.

“Building official” means the officer or other authority designated by the city manager, or a
duly authorized representative, charged with the administration and enforcement of the
adopted administrative and construction codes.

“Building service equipment” means and refers to the plumbing, mechanical and electrical
equipment including piping, wiring, fixtures, and other accessories which provide sanitation,
lighting, heating, ventilation, cooling, refrigeration, firefighting, and transportation facilities
essential to the occupancy of the building or structure for its designated use.

“Complete response” means a written submittal responding to all requests from city staff in
sufficient detail to allow the application to proceed or be processed

“Construction codes” means the construction codes listed in BMC 15.05.015.

“Energy code” means the latest edition of the International Energy Conservation Code
promulgated by the International Code Council as adopted by the city.

“IBC” means the latest edition of the International Building Code promulgated by the
International Code Council as adopted by the city.

“IEBC” means the latest edition of the International Existing Building Code promulgated by the
International Code Council as adopted by the city.

“IPMC” means the Burien Building and Property Maintenance code as adopted by the city of
Burien.

“IMC” means the latest edition of the International Mechanical Code promulgated by the
International Code Council as adopted by the city.

“IRC” means the latest edition of the International Residential Code for One- and Two-Family
Dwellings promulgated by the International Code Council as adopted by the city.

“NEC” means the latest edition of the National Electrical Code promulgated by the National Fire
Protection Association as amended by the Washington Cities Electrical Code and adopted by
the city.

“Occupancy” means the purpose for which a building, or part thereof, is used or intended to be
used.

Page 4 of 46

R:/CC/AAA Ordinances/Ord 583 Bldg & Constr Exhibit A



“Public Service Agency” means those agencies providing non competitive services and rates to
the public for the purpose of delivering electrical, water, sewer or gas utilities. The equipment
installed by a public service agency shall be owned, operated and maintained by that agency.

“Shall” as used in this chapter, is mandatory.

“UPC” means the latest edition of the Uniform Plumbing Code promulgated by the
International Association of Plumbing and Mechanical Officials as adopted by the city.

“Valuation” or “value” as applied to a building, structure, or building service equipment, shall
mean the estimated cost to construct or replace the structure, building and its building service
equipment in kind based on current construction or replacement costs. Current construction or
replacement include fees for all architectural, engineering and construction management
services, and includes all structural, electrical, plumbing, mechanical equipment and labor,
including all contractors’ profits and all on-site preparation costs. The building official is
authorized to utilize two (2) methodologies to determine valuation. The greater of the two
methods (the square footage method vs. the total valuation method) shall be used to
determine the construction valuation for the purpose of computing permit fees.

The valuation for a permit renewal or reinstatement shall be based upon the value of all
work not completed prior to the permit expiration date, with a minimum valuation of $4,000
for each required remaining inspection.

15.05.025 Appendices.
Provisions in the appendices shall not apply unless specifically adopted.

15.05.030 Intent.

The purpose of this code and the construction codes is to establish the minimum
requirements to safeguard the public health, safety and general welfare through structural
strength, means of egress facilities, stability, sanitation, adequate light and ventilation, energy
conservation, and safety to life and property from fire and other hazards attributed to the built
environment and to provide safety to fire fighters and emergency responders during
emergency operations.

15.05.035 Referenced codes.

The codes listed in Sections 15.05.040 through 15.05.85 BMC and referenced elsewhere
in this code shall be considered part of the requirements of this code to the prescribed extent
of each such reference.

15.05.040 International Building Code - Scope.

The provisions of the International Building Code (IBC) shall apply to the construction,
alteration, relocation, enlargement, replacement, repair, equipment, use and occupancy,
location, maintenance, removal, and demolition of every building or structure or any
appurtenances connected or attached to such buildings or structures.

Page 5 of 46

R:/CC/AAA Ordinances/Ord 583 Bldg & Constr Exhibit A



Exception:

1. Detached one- and two-family dwellings and multiple single-family dwellings
(townhouses) not more than three stories above grade plane in height with separate
means of egress and their accessory structures shall comply with the International
Residential Code.

2. Roads, bridges, sidewalks, drainage structures, retaining walls and similar structures
regulated, approved and inspected by the city’s public works department.

3. Electrical transmission towers and telephone poles (not including cell towers) under
the control of a utility.

1505.045 International Residential Code - Scope.

The provisions of the International Residential Code for One- and Two-Family Dwellings
(IRC) shall apply to the construction, alteration, movement, enlargement, replacement, repair,
equipment, use and occupancy, location, maintenance, removal, and demolition of detached
one- and two-family dwellings and multiple single-family dwellings (townhouses) not more than
three stories above grade plane in height with separate means of egress and their accessory
structures.

Exceptions:

1. Live/work units complying with the requirements of Section 419 of the International
Building Code shall be permitted to be built as one- and two-family dwellings or
townhouses. Fire suppression required by Section 419.5 of the International Building
Code when constructed under the International Residential Code for One- and Two-
family Dwellings shall conform to Section P2904 of the International Residential Code

2. Owner-occupied lodging houses with five or fewer guestrooms shall be permitted to
be constructed in accordance with the International Residential Code for One- and Two-
family Dwellings when equipped with a fire sprinkler system in accordance with Section
P2904.

15.05.050 International Mechanical Code - Scope.

The provisions of the International Mechanical Code (IMC) shall apply to the design,
installation, maintenance, alteration and inspection of mechanical systems that are
permanently installed and utilized to provide control of environmental conditions and related
processes within buildings. This code shall also regulate those mechanical systems, system
components, equipment, and appliances specifically addressed herein.

Exceptions:

1. The International Fuel Gas Code (IFGC) shall apply to all installations utilizing
natural gas and gaseous hydrogen except those regulated by the IRC and those
utilizing LPG

Page 6 of 46

R:/CC/AAA Ordinances/Ord 583 Bldg & Constr Exhibit A



2. International Residential Code shall apply to all structures regulated by the IRC
except LPG installations.

3. NFPA 54 (National Fuel Gas Code) and NFPA 58 (Liquid Petroleum Gas Code)
shall apply to all LPG installations for liquefied petroleum gas (LPG) installations.

15.050.055 Liquid Propane Gas Codes - Scope.

The provisions of the National Fuel Gas Code and Liquid Petroleum Gas Code (NFPA 54
and 58) shall apply to the installation of all materials and equipment utilizing liquid propane
gas.

15.05.060 International Fuel Gas Code — Scope.

The provisions of the International Fuel Gas Code (IFGC) shall apply to the installation of
all materials and equipment utilizing natural gas except those regulated by the International
Residential Code.

15.05.065 International Fire Code — Scope.

The provisions of the International Fire Code (IFC) shall apply to matters affecting or
relating to the protection of structures, processes and premises from the hazard of fire and
explosion arising from the storage, handling or use of structures, materials or devices; from
conditions hazardous to life, property or public welfare in the occupancy of structures or
premises; and from the construction, extension, repair, alteration or removal of fire
suppression and alarm systems or fire hazards in the structure or on the premises from
occupancy or operation.

15.05.070 Uniform Plumbing Code - Scope.

The provisions of the Uniform Plumbing Code shall apply to the installation, alteration,
repair and replacement of plumbing systems, including equipment, appliances, fixtures, fittings
and appurtenances, where connected to a water or sewage system and all aspects of a medical
gas system.

15.05.075 Burien Building and Property Maintenance Code - Scope.

The provisions of the Burien Building and Property Maintenance Code shall apply to
existing structure and premises; equipment and facilities; light, ventilation, space heating,
sanitation, life and fire safety hazards; responsibilities of owners, operators and occupants; and
occupancy of existing premises and structures.

15.05.080 International Energy Conservation Code — Scope.

The provisions of the International Energy Conservation Code shall apply to all matters
governing the design and construction of buildings for energy efficiency.

Page 7 of 46

R:/CC/AAA Ordinances/Ord 583 Bldg & Constr Exhibit A



15.05.085 Burien Electrical Code - Scope.

The provisions of the Burien Electrical Code apply to the installation of electric
conductors, electric equipment and additions, alterations, modifications, or repairs to existing
electrical installations for the following:

(1) Electric conductors, electric equipment, and electrical raceways installed within or on
public and private buildings, property or other structures.

(2) Signaling and communications conductors and equipment, telecommunications
conductors and equipment, fiber optic cables, and raceways installed within or on public and
private buildings, property or other structures.

(3) Yards, lots, parking lots, and industrial substations.

(4) Temporary electrical installations for use during the construction of buildings.

(5) Temporary electrical installations for carnivals, conventions, festivals, fairs, traveling
shows, the holding of religious services, temporary lighting of streets, or other approved uses.
(6) Installations of conductors and equipment that connect to a supply of electricity.

(7) All other outside electrical conductors on the premises.

(8) Optional standby systems derived from portable generators.

Exception: Installations under the exclusive control of electric utilities for the purpose of
communication, transmission, and distribution of electric energy located in buildings
used exclusively by utilities for such purposes or located outdoors on property owned or
leased by the utilities or on public highways, streets, roads, etc., or outdoors by
established rights on private property.

It is the intent of this section that the Burien Electrical Code covers all premises’ wiring
or wiring other than utility owned metering equipment, on the load side of the service point of
buildings, structures, or any other premises not owned or leased by the utility. Also, it is the
intent that the Burien Electrical Code covers installations in buildings used by the utility for
purposes other than listed in above, such as offices buildings, warehouses, garages, machine
shops, and recreational buildings which are not an integral part of a generating plant,
substation, or control center.

15.05.090 Applicability.

(1) General. Where there is a conflict between a general requirement and a specific
requirement, the specific requirement shall be applicable. Where in any specific case, different
sections of this code specify different materials, methods of construction or other
requirements, the most restrictive shall govern except that the hierarchy of the codes as
specified in RCW 19.27.031 shall govern.
(2) New Installations. This code applies to new installations.
Exception: If an electrical, plumbing or mechanical permit application is
received after this code has taken effect, but is identified with a building permit

Page 8 of 46

R:/CC/AAA Ordinances/Ord 583 Bldg & Constr Exhibit A



application received prior to the effective date of the ordinance codified in this
chapter, all applicable codes adopted and in force at the time of a complete
building permit application will apply.

(3) Existing installations. Lawfully installed existing installations that do not comply with
the provisions of this chapter shall be permitted to be continued without change, except as is
specifically covered in this chapter, the International Fire Code, or as is deemed necessary by
the building official for the general safety and welfare of the occupants and the public. Where
changes are required for correction of hazards, a reasonable amount of time shall be given for
compliance, depending on the degree of the hazard.

(4) Maintenance. Building and structures, including their electrical, plumbing and
mechanical systems, equipment, materials and appurtenances, both existing and new, and
parts thereof shall be maintained in proper operating condition in accordance with the original
design and in a safe, hazard-free condition. Devices or safeguards that are required by this
chapter shall be maintained in compliance with the code edition under which installed. The
owner or the owner’s designated agent shall be responsible for the maintenance of the systems
and equipment. To determine compliance with this provision, the building official shall have the
authority to require that the systems and equipment be re-inspected.

(5) Additions, alterations, modifications or repairs. Additions, alterations, modifications or
repairs to a building or structure or to the electrical, plumbing or mechanical system(s) of any
building, structure, or premises shall conform to the requirements of this code, without
requiring those portions of the existing building or system not being altered or modified to
comply with all the requirements of this code. Installations, additions, alterations,
modifications, or repairs shall not cause an existing building to become unsafe or to adversely
affect the performance of the building as determined by the building official or designated
representative.

Electrical wiring added to an existing service, feeder, or branch circuit shall not result in
an installation that violates the provisions of the code in force at the time the additions were
made.

Minor additions, alterations, renovations and repairs to existing mechanical systems
shall meet the provisions for new construction, unless such work is done in the same manner
and arrangement as was in the existing system, is not hazardous, and is approved the building
official.

Exceptions:

1. Additions constructed under the International Residential Code with less
than 500 square feet of conditioned floor area are exempt from the
requirements for Whole House Ventilation Systems, Section M1508.

2. Additions or alterations to existing buildings constructed under the
International Residential Code, which do not require the construction of
foundations, crawlspaces, slabs or basements, shall not be required to meet
the requirements for radon protection in Section R327.1 and Appendix F.

15.05.095 Other laws.

Page 9 of 46

R:/CC/AAA Ordinances/Ord 583 Bldg & Constr Exhibit A



The provisions of this code shall not be deemed to nullify any provisions of local, state
or federal law.

15.05.100 Application of references.

References to chapter or section numbers, or to provisions not specifically identified by
number, shall be construed to refer to such chapter, section or provision of this code.

15.05.105 Referenced codes and standards.

The codes and standards referenced in the construction codes shall be considered part
of the requirements of that code to the prescribed extent of each such reference.

Where conflicts occur between provisions of the construction code and referenced
codes and standards, the provisions of the construction code shall apply.

Where the extent of the reference to a referenced code or standard includes subject
matter that is within the scope of the construction codes listed in the Burien Municipal Code,
the provisions of Title 15 BMC and the codes listed in BMC 15.05.15, as applicable, shall take
precedence over the provisions in the referenced code or standard.

15.05.110 Partial invalidity.

In the event that any part or provision of this code is held to be illegal or void, this shall
not have the effect of making void or illegal any of the other parts or provisions.

15.05.115 Existing structures.

The legal occupancy of any structure existing on the date of adoption of this code shall
be permitted to continue without change, except as is specifically covered in_the construction
codes, the Burien Building and Property Maintenance Code, the International Fire Code, or as is
deemed necessary by the building official or fire marshal for the general safety and welfare of
the occupants and the public. Alterations to existing structures shall be permitted to be
performed in accordance with WAC 51-50-48000 (International Existing Building Code).

15.05.120 Maintenance.

Structures and installations, both existing and new, and parts thereof shall be
maintained in proper operating condition in accordance with the original design and in a safe
condition. Devices or safeguards shall be maintained in compliance with the code edition under
which they were constructed or installed. The owner or the owner’s designated agent shall be
responsible for maintenance of structures and installations. To determine compliance with this
provision, the building official shall have the authority to require an installation to be rein-
spected.

15.05.125 Added electrical wiring.
Electrical wiring added to an existing service, feeder, or branch circuit shall not result in

Page 10 of 46

R:/CC/AAA Ordinances/Ord 583 Bldg & Constr Exhibit A



an installation that violates the provisions of the code in force at the time the additions were
made.

15.05.130 Requirements not covered by code.

Requirements necessary for the strength, stability or proper operation of an existing or
proposed structure or installation, or for the public safety, health and general welfare, not
specifically covered by this code, shall be determined by the building official.

15.05.135 Moved buildings.

(1) Buildings or structures moved into or within the city shall comply with the provisions of
the International Residential Code (WAC 51-51), the International Building Code (WAC 51-50),
the International Mechanical Code (WAC 51-52), the International Fire Code (WAC 5154), the
Uniform Plumbing Code and Standards (WAC 51-56 and 51-57), the Washington State Energy
Code (WAC 51-11), and the Washington State Ventilation and Indoor Air Quality Code (WAC 51-
13) for new buildings or structures.

Exceptions: Group R-3 buildings or structures are not required to comply with this
section if:

The original occupancy classification is not changed; and

2. The original building is not substantially remodeled or rehabilitated. For the
purposes of this section, a building shall be considered to be substantially
remodeled when the costs of remodeling exceed 60 percent of the value of the
building exclusive of the costs relating to preparation, construction, demolition,
or renovation of foundations.

(2) Prior to relocation, a feasibility inspection shall be performed on the building or
structure by a registered design professional to document any known structural deficiencies,
examine existing plumbing and mechanical systems, inspect insulated areas of the structure
and check for life safety deficiencies. A copy of the inspection reports shall be submitted along
with a building permit application for relocation.

(3) Structures which do not conform to minimum requirements at the time of initial
construction, or current life safety regulations, or are found substantially deficient in structural
integrity, shall be subject to correction.

(4) See BMC 12.17.095 (Building Moving) for additional permit requirements.

15.05.140 Moved buildings - electrical requirements.

(1) Nonresidential buildings or structures moved into or within the jurisdiction must be
inspected to ensure compliance with current requirements of this chapter.

(2) Residential buildings or structures wired in the U.S. to NEC requirements and moved
into the jurisdiction must be inspected to ensure compliance with the NEC requirements in
effect at the time and place the original wiring was made. The building or structure must be

Page 11 of 46

R:/CC/AAA Ordinances/Ord 583 Bldg & Constr Exhibit A



inspected to ensure compliance with all current requirements of Chapter 19.28 RCW and the
rules developed by the building department if:

(a) The original occupancy classification of the building or structure is changed as a
result of the move; or

(b) The building or structure has been substantially remodeled or rehabilitated as a
result of the move.

(3) Residential buildings or structures wired in Canada to Canadian Electrical Code (CEC)
standards and moved into the jurisdiction must be inspected to ensure compliance with the
following minimum safety requirements:

(a) Service, service grounding, and service bonding must comply with the Burien
Electrical Code.

(b) Canadian Standards Association (CSA) listed Type NMD cable is allowed with the
following qualifications:

(i.) CSA listed Type NMD cable, American Wire Gauge #10 and smaller installed after
1964, utilizing an equipment grounding conductor smaller than the phase
conductors, must be:

A. Replaced with a cable utilizing a full-size equipment grounding conductor; or
B. Protected by a ground fault circuit interrupter protection device.
(ii.) CSA listed Type NMD cable, #8 AWG and larger, must:

A. Utilize an equipment grounding conductor sized according to the
requirements of the NEC in effect at the time of the installation;

B. Be protected by a ground fault circuit interrupter protection device; or
C. Bereplaced.
(c) Other types of wiring and cable must be:

(i.) Replaced with wiring listed or field evaluated in accordance with U.S. standards
by a laboratory approved by the department; or

(ii.) Protected by a ground fault circuit interrupter protection device and arc fault
circuit protection device.

(d) Equipment, other than wiring or panelboards, manufactured and installed prior to
1997, must be listed and identified by laboratory labels approved by the department
or CSA labels.

(e) All panelboards must be listed and identified by testing laboratory labels approved
by the department with the following qualifications:

(i.) CSA listed panelboards labeled "Suitable for Use as Service Equipment" will be
considered to be approved as "Suitable for Use only as Service Equipment."

(ii.) CSA listed panelboards must be limited to a maximum of 42 circuits.

(iii.) CSA listed panelboards used as lighting and appliance panelboards, as
described in the NEC, must meet all current requirements of the NEC and this
chapter.

Page 12 of 46

R:/CC/AAA Ordinances/Ord 583 Bldg & Constr Exhibit A



(f) Any wiring or panelboards replaced or changed as a result of the move must meet
current requirements of Chapter 19.28 RCW and this chapter.

(g) The location, type, and ground fault circuit interrupter protection of receptacles and
equipment in a bathroom, kitchen, basement, garage, or outdoor area must meet
the Washington requirements in effect at the time the wiring was installed.

(h) 4, 15-ampere, kitchen small appliance circuits will be accepted in lieu of 2, 20-
ampere, kitchen small appliance circuits. Receptacles will not be required to be
added on kitchen peninsular or island counters.

(i) Spacing requirements for all other receptacles must meet the Washington
requirements in effect at the time the wiring was installed.

(j) Receptacles installed above baseboard or fixed wall space heaters must be removed
and the outlet box covered with a blank cover. The receptacle is required to be
relocated as closely as possible to the existing location.

(k) Lighting outlet and switch locations must meet the Washington requirements in
effect at the time the wiring was installed.

(I) Dedicated 20-ampere small appliance circuits are not required in dining rooms.
(m) Electric water heater branch circuits must be adequate for the load.

(n) The location, type, and circuit protection of feeders must meet the Washington
State requirements in effect at the time the wiring was installed.

15.05.145 Structures in areas of special flood hazard.

Buildings located in Areas of Special Flood Hazard shall be regulated under the

International Building Code, the International Residential Code and the Burien Municipal Code.

15.05.150 Building department — Established.

There is established for the city the “building department” which shall be under the

supervision and control of the city manager or his/her authorized representative.

15.05.155 Building official designated.

The building official shall be appointed by the city manager.

15.05.160 Deputies.

In accordance with the prescribed procedures of the city of Burien and with the

concurrence of the appointing authority, the building official shall have the authority to appoint
a deputy building official, the related technical officers, inspectors, plan examiners and other
employees. Such employees shall have powers as delegated by the building official.

15.05.165 Duties and power of the building official.

Page 13 of 46

R:/CC/AAA Ordinances/Ord 583 Bldg & Constr Exhibit A



The building official is hereby authorized and directed to enforce the provisions of this
code and Title 15 BMC. The building official shall have the authority to render interpretations of
this code and Title 15 BMC and to adopt policies and procedures in order to clarify the
application of its provisions. Such interpretations, policies and procedures shall be in
compliance with the intent and purpose of this code and Title 15 BMC. Such policies and
procedures shall not have the effect of waiving requirements specifically provided for in this
code and Title 15 BMC.

15.05.170 Applications and permits.

The building official shall receive applications, review construction documents and issue
permits for the erection, alteration, demolition and moving of buildings, structures and building
service equipment, inspect the premises for which such permits have been issued, and enforce
compliance with the provisions of this code and the construction codes.

15.05.175 Notices and orders.

(1) The building official shall have the authority to issue all necessary notices or orders to
ensure compliance with this code.

(2) Following a city of Burien issued formal declaration of emergency, the building official
shall be authorized to evaluate and provide building safety evaluations. Evaluations shall
generally follow standards from the Applied Technology Council ATC 20, ATC 20-1, or ATC 45
manuals. The procedure shall allow for the tagging of buildings as “Inspected”, “Limited Entry”
or “Unsafe”, along with a associated penalties per BMC 15.05.405 and BMC 15.05.410 of this
code for removal of building tags. Notice of orders pertaining to dangerous buildings and
appeal procedures established under adopted building codes shall not apply under official
declarations of emergency.

15.05.180 Inspections.

The building official shall make all of the required inspections and shall have the
authority to accept reports of inspection by approved agencies or individuals. Reports of such
inspections shall be in writing and be certified by a responsible officer of such approved agency
or by the responsible individual. The building official is authorized to engage such expert
opinion as deemed necessary to report upon unusual technical issues that arise, at the
applicant’s expense.

15.05.185 Identification.

Building department personnel shall carry proper identification when inspecting
structures or premises in the performance of duties under this code.

15.05.190 Right of entry.

Page 14 of 46

R:/CC/AAA Ordinances/Ord 583 Bldg & Constr Exhibit A



Where it is necessary to make an inspection to enforce the provisions of this code, or
where the building official has reasonable cause to believe that there exists in a structure or
upon a premises a condition which is contrary to or in violation of this code which makes the
structure or premises unsafe, dangerous or hazardous, the building official is authorized to
enter the structure or premises at reasonable times to inspect or to perform the duties
imposed by this code, provided that if such structure or premises be occupied that credentials
be presented to the occupant and entry requested. If such structure or premises is unoccupied,
the building official shall first make a reasonable effort to locate the owner or other person
having charge or control of the structure or premises and request entry. If entry is refused, the
building official shall have recourse to the remedies provided by law to secure entry.

15.05.195 Department records.

The city shall keep official records of applications received, permits and certificates
issued, fees collected, reports of inspections, and notices and orders issued. Such records shall
be retained in the official records for the period required for retention of public records.

15.05.200 Liability.

This title shall not be construed to relieve or lessen the responsibility of any person,
partnership, firm, association, or corporation owning, building, altering, constructing, or moving
any building or structure as defined in this title; nor shall the city or any agent thereof be held
as assuming such liability by reason of inspection authorized herein or a certificate of inspection
issued by the city or any of its agencies.

The building official or employee charged with the enforcement of this code and Title 15
BMC, while acting for the city of Burien in good faith and without malice in the discharge of the
duties required by this code and Title 15 BMC or other pertinent law or ordinance, shall not
thereby be rendered liable personally and is hereby relieved from personal liability for any
damage accruing to persons or property as a result of any act or by reason of an act or omission
in the discharge of official duties. Any suit instituted against an officer or employee because of
an act performed by that officer or employee in the lawful discharge of duties and under the
provisions of this code and Title 15 BMC shall be defended by legal representative of the city of
Burien until the final termination of the proceedings. The building official or any subordinate
shall not be liable for cost in any action, suit or proceeding that is instituted in pursuance of the
provisions of this code and Title 15 BMC.

15.05.205 Approved materials and equipment.

Materials, equipment and devices approved by the building official shall be constructed
and installed in accordance with such approval.

15.05.210 Used materials and equipment.

Page 15 of 46

R:/CC/AAA Ordinances/Ord 583 Bldg & Constr Exhibit A



The use of used materials and building service equipment which meet the requirements
of this code for new materials is permitted. Used equipment and devices shall not be reused
unless approved by the building official.

15.05.215 Modifications.

Wherever there are practical difficulties involved in carrying out the provisions of this
code, the building official shall have the authority to grant modifications for individual cases,
upon application of the owner or owner’s representative, provided the building official shall
first find that special individual reason makes the strict letter of this code impractical and the
modification is in compliance with the intent and purpose of this code and that such
modification does not lessen health, accessibility, life and fire safety, or structural
requirements. The details of action granting modifications shall be recorded and entered in the
files of the department. The building official is authorized to charge an additional fee to
evaluate any proposed modification under the provisions of this section.

15.05.220 Alternative materials, design and methods of construction and equipment.

The provisions of this code are not intended to prevent the installation of any material
or to prohibit any design or method of construction not specifically prescribed by this code,
provided that any such alternative has been approved the building official as provided herein.
An alternative material, design or method of construction shall be approved where the building
official finds that the proposed design is satisfactory and complies with the intent of the
provisions of this code and that the material, method or work offered is, for the purpose
intended, at least the equivalent of that prescribed in this code in quality, strength,
effectiveness, fire resistance, durability and safety. The building official is authorized to charge
an additional fee to evaluate any proposed alternate material, design and or method of
construction and equipment under the provisions of this section.

15.05.225 Research reports.

Supporting data, where necessary to assist in the approval of materials or assemblies
not specifically provided for in this code, shall consist of valid research reports from approved
sources.

15.05.230 Tests.

Whenever there is insufficient evidence of compliance with the provisions of this code,
or evidence that a material or method does not conform to the requirements of this code, or in
order to substantiate claims for alternative materials or methods, the building official shall have
the authority to require tests as evidence of compliance to be made at no expense to the city of
Burien. Test methods shall be as specified in this code or by other recognized test standards. In
the absence of recognized and accepted test methods, the building official shall approve the
testing procedures. Tests shall be performed by an approved agency. Reports of such tests shall
be retained by the city for the period required for retention of public records.

Page 16 of 46

R:/CC/AAA Ordinances/Ord 583 Bldg & Constr Exhibit A



15.05.235 Permits required.

Any owner or authorized agent who intends to construct, enlarge, alter, repair, move,
demolish, or change the occupancy of a building or structure, or to erect, install, enlarge, alter,
repair, remove, convert or replace any electrical, gas, mechanical or plumbing system, the
installation of which is regulated by this code, or to cause any such work to be done, shall first
make application to the city and obtain the required permit. A separate permit is required for
each building or structure.

Exceptions:

1. When deemed appropriate by the building official, accessory buildings and
structures may be included under the permit of the main building or structure.

2. A single demolition permit may be issued for the demolition of multiple
structures on a single tax parcel.

15.05.240 Electrical permit required.

In accordance with Chapter 19.28 RCW, an electrical permit is required for the following
installations:

(1) The installation, alteration, repair, replacement, modification or maintenance of all
electrical systems, wire and electrical equipment regardless of voltage.

(2) The installation and/or alteration of low voltage systems defined as:

(a) NEC, Class 1 power limited circuits at thirty volts maximum.

(b) NEC, Class 2 circuits powered by a Class 2 power supply as defined in NEC
725.41(A).

(c) NEC, Class 3 circuits powered by a Class 3 power supply as defined in NEC
725.41(A).

(3) Telecommunications Systems.

(a) Installation of telecommunications systems on the customer side of the network
demarcation point for projects greater than ten telecommunications outlets.

(b) All backbone installations, regardless of size, and all telecommunications cable or
equipment installations involving penetrations of fire barriers or passing through
hazardous locations.

(c) The installation of greater than ten outlets and the associated cables along any
horizontal pathway from a telecommunications closet to work areas during any
continuous ninety-day period requires a permit and inspection.

(d) Backbone installations in multifamily residential dwellings which require
penetration of fire barriers or installation of more than ten outlets in common
areas.

(e) Definitions of telecommunications technical terms shall be as set forth in

Chapter 19.28 RCW, EIA/TIA standards, and the Burien Electrical Code.

Page 17 of 46

R:/CC/AAA Ordinances/Ord 583 Bldg & Constr Exhibit A



15.05.245

Work exempt from permit.

Exemptions from permit requirements of this code shall not be deemed to grant
authorization for any work to be done in any manner in violation of the provisions of this code
or any other laws or ordinances of the city of Burien. Permits shall not be required for the
following except when located in a special flood hazard area or other areas within the city
requiring critical area review by the zoning code:

(1) Building:

(a)

(b)
(c)
(d)

(e)

(f)

(8)

(h)

(i)

)

(k)

(1)

(m)

One-story detached accessory structures which are accessory to residential
buildings and constructed under the provisions of the IRC used as tool and
storage sheds, tree supported play structures, playhouse and similar uses,
provided the floor area does not exceed 200 square feet (18.58 m2) and the
structure is located in accordance with all land use regulations.

Fences 6 feet (1829 mm) or less in height
Oil derricks.

Retaining walls which are 4 feet (1219 mm) or less in height measured from the
bottom of the footing to the top of the wall, unless supporting a surcharge or
impounding Class |, Il or lll-A liquids.

Water tanks not utilized for fire protection water supplies which are supported
directly on grade, if the capacity is 5,000 gallons (18 925 L) or less and the ratio of
height to diameter or width does not exceed 2 to 1.

Sidewalks and driveways that are not part of an accessible route.

Decks, associated platforms and steps accessory to buildings, which are 30 inches
(762 mm) or less above adjacent grade and which are not over any basement or
story below and which are not part of an accessible route.

Painting, papering, tiling, carpeting, cabinets, counter tops and similar finish
work, provided that existing accessible features are not altered.

Replacement of nonstructural siding on IRC structures, except for veneer, stucco
or “Exterior Finish and Insulation Systems” (EFIS).

In-kind re-roofing of one- and two-family dwellings provided the roof sheathing is
not removed or replaced.

Window replacement for IRC structures in Airport Noise Reduction Area 3, where
no alteration of structural members is required, the window U-Values meet the
prescriptive requirements of the International Energy Conservation Code, the
window glazing is not required to be safety glass, and minimum dimensions and
placement of any required egress window is not reduced.

Temporary motion picture, television, and theater stage sets and scenery.

Prefabricated swimming pools accessory to a One- and Two-Family Dwelling or
Group R-3 occupancy, which are less than 24 inches (610 mm) deep, do not
exceed 5,000 gallons (18 925 L) and are installed entirely above ground.

Page 18 of 46

R:/CC/AAA Ordinances/Ord 583 Bldg & Constr Exhibit A



(n)

(o)

(p)

(a)

(r)

(s)

(t)

(u)

(v)

Shade cloth structures constructed for garden, nursery or agricultural purposes
and not including service systems.

Swings, slides and other similar playground equipment accessory to a One or
Two-Family Dwelling or Group R-3 occupancy.

Window awnings that are supported by an exterior wall of One- and Two-Family
Dwellings, Group R-3 occupancies, or Group U occupancies and that do not
project more than 54 inches (1372 mm) from the exterior wall and do not require
additional support.

Non-fixed and movable cases, counters and partitions 5 feet 9 inches (1753 mm)
or less in height.

Satellite earth station antennas 6-1/2 feet (2 m) or less in diameter or diagonal
dimensions in zones other than residential zones.

Satellite earth station antennas 3-1/4 feet (1m ) or less in diameter in residential
zones.

Video programming service antennas 3-1/4 feet (1 m) or less in diameter or
diagonal dimension, regardless of zone.

Job shacks that are placed at the job site during a construction project, for which
a permit has been issued or applied, may be allowed on a temporary basis and
shall be removed upon final approval of construction. A job shack is a portable
structure, for which the primary purpose is to house equipment and supplies and
which may serve as a temporary office during construction for the purposes of
the construction project.

Electrical transmission towers and telephone poles, hydraulic flood control

structures, and other structures under the control of a public utility or public
agency, which are located in a public right of way or public easement.

(2) Electrical:

(a)

(b)

(c)

(d)

(e)

(f)

Portable motors or other portable appliances which are energized by means of a
cord or cable having an attachment plug end to be connected to an approved
receptacle, when that cord or cable is permitted by the National Electrical Code.

Repair or replacement of fixed motors, transformers, or fixed approved
appliances or devices rated fifty amps or less and which are like-in-kind and in
the same location.

Temporary decorative lighting; when used for a period not to exceed ninety days
and removed at the conclusion of the ninety-day period.

Repair or replacement of current-carrying parts of any switch, conductor or
control device, which are like-in-kind and in the same location.

Repair or replacement of attachment plug(s) and associated receptacle(s) rated
fifty amperes or less, which are like-in-kind in the same location.

Repair or replacement of any over current device, which is like-in-kind and in the
same location.

Page 19 of 46

R:/CC/AAA Ordinances/Ord 583 Bldg & Constr Exhibit A



(g)

(h)

)

(k)

(1)

(m)
(n)

(o)

(3) Gas:

(a)
(b)

Repair or replacement of electrodes or transformers of the same size and
capacity for signs or gas tube systems.

Removal of electrical wiring.
Telecommunication outlet installations within individual dwelling units.

Listed wireless security systems for which power is supplied by a listed Class 2
plug-in transformer and which are installed within dwelling units

The installation, alteration or repair of electrical wiring, apparatus or equipment
or the generation, transmission, distribution or metering of electrical energy or
in the operation of signals or the transmission of intelligence, by a public or
private utility in the exercise of its function as a serving utility.

Portable generators serving only cord and plug connected loads supplied
through receptacles on the generator.

Travel trailers.

Like-in-kind replacement of one or more of the following: contactor, relay,
timer, starter, circuit board, or similar control component; household appliance;
circuit breaker; fuse; residential luminaire; lamp; snap switch; dimmer;
receptacle outlet; thermostat; heating element; luminaire ballast with an exact
same ballast; component(s) of electric signs, outline lighting, skeleton neon
tubing, when replaced on-site by an appropriate electrical contractor and when
the sign, outline lighting or skeleton neon tubing electrical system is not
modified; ten horsepower or smaller motor; and induction detection loops that
comply with WAC 296-46B-300(2) and are used to control gate access devices.

All wiring for low voltage installations within a one-family dwelling unit or its
accessory structure except wired security, fire or smoke alarm systems, provided
the power is supplied by a listed Class 2 power supply and none of the wiring
penetrates the wall or ceiling between the dwelling unit and an attached garage,
or wall separating two dwelling units.

Portable heating, cooking or clothes drying appliances.
Replacement of any minor part that does not alter its approval or make it unsafe.

(4) Mechanical:

(a)
(b)
(c)
(d)

(e)
(f)
(g)

Portable heating, cooking or clothes drying appliances.
Portable ventilation equipment.
Portable cooling units.

Steam, hot or chilled water piping that is within any heating or cooling equipment
regulated by this code.

Replacement of any part which does not alter its approval or make it unsafe.

Portable evaporative coolers.

Self-contained refrigeration systems containing 10 pounds (4.54 kg) or less of
refrigerant and actuated by motors of 1 horsepower (746 W) or less.

Page 20 of 46

R:/CC/AAA Ordinances/Ord 583 Bldg & Constr Exhibit A



(h)

Portable fuel cell appliances that are not connected to a fixed piping system and

are not interconnected.

(5) Plumbing:

(a)

(b)

(c)

The stopping and/or repairing of leaks in drains, water, soil, waste or vent pipes,
provided, however, that should any concealed trap, drain pipe, water, soil, waste
or vent pipe become defective and it becomes necessary to remove and replace
the same with new material, the same shall be considered as new work and a
permit shall be obtained and inspection made as provided in this code.

The clearing of stoppages or the repairing of leaks in pipes, valves or fixtures and
the removal and reinstallation of water closets, provided such repairs do not
involve or require replacement or rearrangement of valves, pipes or fixtures.

Reinstallation or replacement of approved pre-fabricated fixtures that do not
involve or require the replacement or rearrangement of valves or pipes.

(6) Grading:

(a)

(b)
(c)
(d)
(e)
(f)

(8)

(h)

(i)

()

15.05.250

Grading in an isolated, self-contained area, provided that there is no danger to
the public and such grading will not adversely affect adjoining properties, as
determined by the building official.

Excavation for construction of a structure permitted under this code.
Cemetery graves.

Refuse disposal sites controlled by other regulations.

Excavations for wells and trenches for utilities.

Mining, quarrying, excavating, processing or stockpiling rock, sand, gravel,
aggregate or clay controlled by other regulations, provided such operations do
not affect the lateral support of, or significantly increase stresses in, soil on
adjoining properties.

Exploratory excavations performed under the direction of a registered design
professional.

An excavation below existing finished grade for basements and footings of an
existing building, retaining wall or other structure, for which the structure is
authorized by a valid building permit.

An excavation of less than 50 cubic yards of material, which is less than 2 feet in
depth and which does not create a cut slope of a ratio steeper than two
horizontal to one vertical.

A fill of less than 50 cubic yards of material, which is less than 1 foot in depth and
placed on natural terrain with a slope flatter than five horizontal to one vertical.

Emergency repairs.

Page 21 of 46

R:/CC/AAA Ordinances/Ord 583 Bldg & Constr Exhibit A



Where equipment replacements and equipment repairs must be performed in an
emergency situation, the permit application shall be submitted to the city within the next
working business day.

15.05.255 Ordinary repairs.

Application or notice to the building official is not required for ordinary repairs to
structures, replacement of lamps, or the connection of approved portable electrical equipment
to approved permanently installed receptacles. Such repairs shall not include the cutting away
of any wall, partition or portion thereof, the removal or cutting of any structural beam or load-
bearing support, or the removal or change of any required means of egress, or rearrangement
of parts of a structure affecting the egress requirements; nor shall ordinary repairs include
addition to, alteration of, replacement, or relocation of, any standpipe, water supply, sewer,
drainage, drain leader, gas, soil, waste, vent or similar piping, electric wiring or mechanical or
other work affecting public health or general safety.

15.05.260 Public service agencies.

A permit shall not be required for the installation, alteration or repair of generation,
transmission, distribution or metering, or other related equipment, which is under the
ownership and control of public service agencies..

15.05.265 Application for permit.

To obtain a permit the applicant shall first file a complete permit application in writing
on a form furnished by the building department for that purpose. Such application shall include:
(2) A description of the work to be covered by the permit for which application is made.

(2) The legal description or tax parcel number, and the street address if available, which will
readily identify and definitely locate the proposed building or work.

(3) The property owner’s name, address, and phone number.

(4) The prime contractor’s business name, address, phone number, and current state
contractor registration number.

(5) For building projects valued at over five thousand dollars, either:

(a) The name, address, and phone number of the office of the lender administering
the interim construction financing, if any; or

(b) The name and address of the firm that has issued a payment bond, if any, on
behalf of the prime contractor for the protection of the owner, if the bond is for
an amount not less than fifty percent of the total amount of the construction
project.

(6) The use or occupancy for which the proposed work is intended.

(7) Plans, diagrams, computations and specifications and other information as required in
BMC 15.05.315, 15.05.320 and 15.05.350.

(8) Valuation of the proposed work.

Page 22 of 46

R:/CC/AAA Ordinances/Ord 583 Bldg & Constr Exhibit A



(9) Signature of the applicant or the applicant’s authorized agent.
(10)  Such other data and information as required by the city.

The information required on the building permit application by subsections (2) through
(5) of this section shall be set forth on the building permit document, which is issued to the
owner, and on the inspection record card, which shall be posted at the construction site.

If the information required by subsection (5) of this section is not available at the time
the application is submitted, the applicant shall so state, and the application shall be processed
and the permit issued as if the information had been supplied, and the lack of the information
shall not cause the application to be deemed incomplete for the purposes of vesting. However,
the applicant shall provide such information as soon as the applicant can reasonably obtain
such information.

15.05.270 Areas of flood hazard.

Areas prone to flooding and designated in Areas of Flood Hazard shall provide
application information per Burien Municipal Code Chapter 15.55

15.05.275 Action on permit application.

City staff shall examine or cause to be examined applications for permits and
amendments thereto, prior to acceptance of the building, plumbing, mechanical, electrical, fire
prevention or related permit application. If the application is incomplete or the construction
documents or other submittal information lacks sufficient information to demonstrate
compliance with applicable codes and standards, the application shall be returned to the
applicant stating the reasons therefore. If city staff is satisfied that the application and
construction documents are complete and provide sufficient information to proceed with
review, the building official shall accept the permit application and collect the appropriate
submittal fees.

Notwithstanding the language of this section or any other provision of this code, no
building permit shall be issued, until all other project permits related to the project action for
which the building permit is sought have been approved and issued and all related fees, bonds,
and approval conditions have been paid and/or satisfied, including but not limited to: SEPA
approvals, subdivisions, building site plans, variances, shoreline permits, and frontage
improvement requirements.

(2) Revisions to the submittal documents, not requested by the city, may be accepted by
the city; however the revisions may result in additional fees being assessed. Substantial
revisions may require a new permit application to be submitted, as determined by the building
official.

15.05.280 Time limitation on permit application.

(1) Permit applications that are received on or after July 1, 2010 for which no permit is
issued within 18 months following the date of application shall expire by limitation, and plans

Page 23 of 46

R:/CC/AAA Ordinances/Ord 583 Bldg & Constr Exhibit A



and other data submitted for review may thereafter be returned to the applicant or destroyed
in accordance with state law.

(2) Permit applications that were received on or before June 30, 2010 for which no permit
has been issued shall be permitted to remain active until December 31, 2011. If at that time the
permit is not issued, the application shall expire by limitation, and plans and other data
submitted for review may thereafter be returned to the applicant or destroyed in accordance
with state law. Where the original permit application was received prior to July 1, 2007, the
building official is authorized to require plans and other supporting information to be updated
to current codes in order for the permit application to remain active in accordance with this
section.

(3) Existing and new applications for which no permit has been issued may be canceled for
inactivity, if an applicant fails to respond to the building official’s written request for revisions,
corrections, actions or additional information within 90 days of the date of request. The
building official may extend the response period beyond 90 days, if within the original 90-day
time period the applicant provides and subsequently adheres to an approved schedule with
specific target dates for submitting the full revisions, corrections or other information
requested by the building official.

(4) The building official may extend the life of an application for an additional 180 days
beyond the expiration period established in subsection (1) of this section, if any of the following
conditions exist:

(a) Compliance with the State Environmental Policy Act is in progress;

(b) Any other city review is in progress, provided the applicant has submitted a
complete response to city requests for information or corrections;

(c) The building official determines that unique or unusual circumstances exist that
warrant additional time for such response, and the building official determines that
the review is proceeding in a timely manner toward the final city decision; or

(d) Litigation against the city or applicant is in progress, the outcome of which may
affect the validity or the provisions of any permit issued pursuant to such
application.

(5) The building official may place a permit application on hold for up to one year, if
requested to do so in writing by a permit applicant.

(6) Any balance owing for plan review or other review fees shall be paid prior to any
approval for extension of the permit application.

15.05.285 Validity of permit.

The issuance or granting of a permit shall not be construed to be a permit for, or an
approval of, any violation of any of the provisions of this chapter or the construction codes or of
any other ordinance of the city. Permits presuming to give authority to violate or cancel the
provisions of this code or the construction codes or other ordinances of the city shall not be
valid. The issuance of a permit based on construction documents and other data shall not
prevent the building official from requiring the correction of errors in the construction

Page 24 of 46

R:/CC/AAA Ordinances/Ord 583 Bldg & Constr Exhibit A



documents and other data. The building official is also authorized to prevent occupancy or use
of a structure when in violation of this code or of any other ordinances of the city. This section
shall be applied, implemented and interpreted consistent with the statutes and court decisions
of the State of Washington.

15.05.290 Permit Expiration.

(1) Every issued permit shall expire 2-years from the date of issuance. The building official
may approve a request for an extended expiration date, when construction work is performed
in phases extending beyond the 2-year period due to the unique size and scope of project work
and a construction schedule is provided by the applicant and approved prior to permit issuance.

(2) Permits issued for applications submitted prior to July 1, 2010 shall be valid for 2 years
from the date of adoption of this code, unless a written request for extension is approved by
the building official prior to permit expiration or the permit is renewed in accordance with BMC
15.05.295. Where new codes have been adopted or required to be enforced per RCW 19.27
since the time of permit issuance, the building official is authorized to require construction
documents to be updated to current codes and submitted as a permit revision for review and
approval by city staff.

(3) Mechanical, plumbing, electrical and other ancillary permits shall expire at the same
time as the associated building permit, except that if no associated building permit is issued,
the mechanical, plumbing, electrical, and/or other ancillary permit shall expire 2 years from the
date of issuance.

15.05.295 Permit Extensions and Renewals
Permits may be extended, renewed or re-established by the building official in
compliance with the terms and conditions of this section.

(1) Permit Extensions. A permit expiration date may be extended in accordance with the
following:

(a) The written request for extension is received prior to the date of permit expiration.

(b) Upon written request from the owner, the building official or authorized
representative is authorized to extend the expiration date up to 90 days with no
additional fee, when all inspections except final inspection have been performed
and approved. If all work is not completed within the 90-day extension period, the
permit shall expire unless renewed under the provisions of subsection (2) of this
section.

(2) Permit Renewals. A permit may be renewed for a period of no more than 1 year from
the date of original expiration in accordance with the following:

(a) A written request for renewal shall be received prior to the date of permit
expiration.

(b) A permit may be renewed one time subject to approval by the building official, as
long as no unauthorized changes have been made to the originally approved plans
and the applicant continues to make regular requests for inspections.

Page 25 of 46

R:/CC/AAA Ordinances/Ord 583 Bldg & Constr Exhibit A



(c) The applicant shall pay an additional fee based on the valuation of the work
remaining to be inspected.

(3) Expired permit re-establishment. A permit that has expired may be re-established one
time in accordance with the following:

(a) A written request for re-establishment is received by the building official within 6
months after the date of permit expiration.

(b) No unauthorized changes have been made to the originally approved plans, and the
applicant agrees to make regular requests for inspections.

(c) The applicant shall pay an additional fee based on the valuation of the work
remaining to be inspected.

(d) The re-established permit shall expire 1 year from the date of reestablishment and
may not be further renewed or extended.

15.05.300 Permit suspension or revocation.

The building official is authorized to suspend or revoke a permit issued under the
provisions of this code, whenever the permit is issued in error or on the basis of incorrect,
inaccurate or incomplete information, or when the permit is in violation of any ordinance or
regulation or any of the provisions of this code. This section shall be applied, implemented and
interpreted consistent with the statutes and court decisions of the State of Washington.

15.05.305 Placement of permit.

The building permit or copy shall be kept on the site of the work until the completion of
the project.

15.05.310 Floor and roof design loads.

(1) Live Loads Posted. Where the live load for which each floor or portion thereof of a
commercial or industrial building is or has been designed to exceed 50 psf (2.40kN/m?), such
design live load shall be conspicuously posted by the owner in that part of each story in which
they apply, using durable signs. It shall be unlawful to remove or deface such notices.

(2) Issuance of certificate of occupancy. A certificate of occupancy required by BMC
15.05.390 shall not be issued until the floor load signs required by this section have been
installed.

(3) Restrictions on loading. It shall be unlawful to place, cause or permit to be placed, on
any floor or room of a building structure or portion thereof, a load greater than is permitted by
this code.

15.05.315 Submittal documents.

Submittal documents, consisting of construction documents, statement of special
inspection, geotechnical reports, and other data, shall be submitted with each permit
application. The construction documents shall be prepared by a registered design professional

Page 26 of 46

R:/CC/AAA Ordinances/Ord 583 Bldg & Constr Exhibit A



when required by the State of Washington. Where special conditions exist, the building official
is authorized to require additional construction documents to be prepared by a registered
design professional.

Exception: The building official is authorized to waive the submission of construction
documents and other data not required to be prepared by a registered design
professional, if it is found that the nature of the work applied for is such that review of
construction documents is not necessary to obtain compliance with this code.

15.05.320

Construction documents.

(1) Building.

(a)

(b)

(c)

(d)

(e)

Information on construction documents. Construction documents shall be
dimensioned and drawn upon material acceptable to the building official. Electronic
media documents are permitted to be submitted when approved by the building
official. Construction documents shall be of sufficient clarity to indicate the location,
nature and extent of the work proposed in the proper orientation and layout as it is
to be constructed and shall show in detail that the work will conform to the
provisions of this code and relevant laws, ordinances, rules and regulations, as
determined by the building official. The plans must include the relevant items listed
in this section and any other information or documents as deemed necessary by the
building official.

Braced wall lines. All braced wall lines shall be identified on the construction
documents, and all pertinent information, including, but not limited to, bracing
methods, location and length of braced wall panels, and foundation requirements of
braced wall panels at top and bottom, shall be provided.

Fire protection system shop drawings. Shop drawings for the fire protection
system(s) shall be submitted to indicate conformance with this code and the
construction documents and shall be approved prior to the start of system
installation. Shop drawings shall contain all information as required by the
referenced installation standards in Chapter 9 of the IBC. Shop drawings shall be
prepared by a certified individual as required by the State of Washington.

Means of egress. In occupancies within the scope of the International Residential
Code the construction documents shall show in sufficient detail the location,
construction, size and character of all portions of the means of egress in compliance
with the provisions of the International Residential Code. In occupancies within the
scope of the International Building Code, the construction documents shall show in
sufficient detail the location, construction, size and character of all portions of the
means of egress including the path of the exit discharge to the public way in
compliance with the International Building Code. In other than Group R-3
occupancies, the construction documents shall designate the number of occupants
to be accommodated on every floor, and in all rooms and spaces.

Exterior wall envelope. Construction documents for all buildings shall describe the
exterior wall envelope in sufficient detail to determine compliance with this code.

Page 27 of 46

R:/CC/AAA Ordinances/Ord 583 Bldg & Constr Exhibit A



The construction documents shall provide details of the exterior wall envelope as
required, including flashing, intersections with dissimilar materials, corners, end
details, control joints, intersections at roof, eaves or parapets, means of drainage,
water-resistive membrane, and details around openings. The construction
documents shall include manufacturer’s installation instructions, which provides
supporting documentation that the proposed penetration and opening details
described in the construction documents maintain the weather resistance of the
exterior wall envelope. The supporting documentation shall fully describe the
exterior wall system which was tested, and where applicable, the test procedure
used. In addition to these requirements, multi-unit structures as defined in RCW
64.55.010 shall comply with the submittal requirements listed in RCW 64.55.020.

Exception: Subject to the approval of the building official, R-3, One- and
Two-Family Dwellings, and their accessory structures may be exempted from the
detailing requirements of this subsection.

(f) Site plan. The construction documents submitted with the permit application shall
be accompanied by a site plan, showing to scale the size and location of new
construction and existing structures on the site, distances from lot lines, the
established street grades, and the proposed finished grades and, as applicable, flood
hazard areas, floodways, and design flood elevations. The site plan shall be drawn in
accordance with an accurate boundary line survey. In the case of demolition, the site
plan shall show construction to be demolished and the location and size of existing
structures and construction that are to remain on the site or plot. The building
official is authorized to waive or modify the requirement for a site plan, when the
application for permit is for alteration or repair or when otherwise warranted.

(g) Design flood elevations. Where design flood elevations are not specified, they shall
be established in accordance with Section 1612.3.1 of the IBC and BMC 15.55.

(2) Electrical.

(a) Electrical plans. Electrical plans for the following installations shall be prepared by,
or under the direction of, an electrical engineer registered under Chapter 18.43 RCW
and Chapters 392-344, 246-320, and 388-97 WAC. All electrical plans must bear the
engineer’s stamp and signature:

(i.) All educational facilities, hospitals, and nursing homes;

(ii.) All services or feeders rated 1,600 amperes or larger;

(iii.)  All installations identified in the National Electrical Code as requiring
engineering supervision; and

(iv.) As required by the building official for installations which by their nature are
complex, hazardous, or pose unique design problems.

(b) Construction documents. Construction documents shall identify the name and
classification of the facility and clearly show the electrical installation or alteration in
floor plan view, include all switchboard and panelboard schedules, and, when a
service or feeder is to be installed or altered, must include a riser diagram, load
calculation, fault current calculation, and interrupting rating of equipment.

Page 28 of 46

R:/CC/AAA Ordinances/Ord 583 Bldg & Constr Exhibit A



(c) Penetrations. Construction documents shall indicate where penetrations will be
made for electrical systems and shall indicate the materials and methods for
maintaining required structural safety, fire-resistance rating, and fireblocking.

(d

~

Load calculations. Where an addition or alteration is made to an existing electrical
system, an electrical load calculation shall be prepared to determine if the existing
electrical service has the capacity to serve the added load.

(e) Site plan. The construction documents submitted with the application for permit
shall be accompanied by a site plan, showing to scale the size and location of new
construction and existing structures on the site, distances from lot lines, the
established street grades, and the proposed finished grades. The site plan shall be
drawn in accordance with an accurate boundary line survey. In the case of
demolition, the site plan shall show construction to be demolished and the location
and size of existing structures and construction that are to remain on the site or plot.
The building official is permitted to waive or modify the requirement for a site plan,
where the application for permit is for alteration or repair or where otherwise
warranted.

(f) Plan review required. Electrical plan review is required for all new or altered
electrical projects in the following occupancies and/or installations including but not
limited to:

(i) Educational, institutional, or health care facilities/buildings as follows:
A. Hospitals.
B. Nursing home units or long-term care units.
C. Boarding homes.
D. Assisted living facilities.
E.Private alcoholism hospitals.
F.Alcoholism treatment facilities.
G. Private psychiatric hospitals.
H. Maternity homes.
I. Ambulatory surgery facilities
J. Renal hemodialysis clinics.

K. Residential treatment facilities for psychiatrically impaired children and
youth.

L.Adult residential rehabilitation centers.
M. Educational facilities.
N. Institutional facilities.

Exceptions: Electrical Plan review is not required for the following types of
installations in the above educational, institutional, or health care facilities
buildings:

Page 29 of 46

R:/CC/AAA Ordinances/Ord 583 Bldg & Constr Exhibit A



1. Lighting specific projects that result in an electrical load reduction on each
feeder involved in the project.

Low voltage systems.

Modification to existing electrical installations when all of the following
conditions are met:

3.1. Service or distribution equipment involved is rated 100 amperes or
greater and does not exceed 250 volts;

3.2. Does not involve emergency systems other than listed unit
equipment per NEC 700.12(F);

3.3. Does not involve branch circuits or feeders of an essential electrical
system as defined in NEC 517.2; and

3.4. Service and feeder load calculations are increased by 5% or less.

4. Stand-alone utility fed services that do not exceed 250 volts, 100 amperes,
where the project’s distribution system does not include:

4.1. Emergency systems other than listed unit equipment per NEC
700.12(F);

4.2. Critical branch circuits or feeders as defined in NEC 517.2, or
4.3. Arequired fire pump system.
(ii) Alterations in non-residential occupancies 2,500 square feet and greater.

(iii) Installations in occupancies except One and Two Family Dwellings where a
service or feeder rated 100 amperes or greater is installed or altered or if more
than 100 amperes is added to the service or feeder.

(iv) All work on electrical systems operating at/over 600 Volts.

(v) All commercial generator installations or alterations.

(vi) All work in areas classified as hazardous locations by the NEC.
(vii) 1f 60% or more of luminaires change.

(viii) Installations of switches or circuit breakers rated four hundred amperes or
over except for one and two family dwellings.

(ix) Wind driven generators.
(x) Solar photovoltaic systems.

(xi) Any proposed installation which cannot be adequately described in the
application form.

(xii) Temporary electrical services exceeding 400 amps.

(3) Plumbing. Plans must be submitted for review and approval whenever the scope of the
work includes:

(a) New non-residential or mixed use buildings.

Page 30 of 46

R:/CC/AAA Ordinances/Ord 583 Bldg & Constr Exhibit A



(b) New multifamily projects with 3 or more dwelling units (except townhomes as defined
in the IRC).

(c) Non-residential or mixed-use addition or alteration projects with more than 10 fixtures
added or altered.

(d) Roof drains/overflow systems.

(e) Tenant improvements involving medical gas piping, commercial kitchens, and food
service installations.

(f) Oil/Water separator or grease interceptor installation.
(g) Sumps for non-residential use.

(h) All types of laboratories.

(i) Addition of washing machines in multi-family units.

Construction documents for buildings more than two stories in height shall indicate
where penetrations will be made for plumbing systems and the materials and methods for
maintaining required structural safety, fire-resistance rating and fireblocking.

(4) Mechanical. Plans must be submitted for review and approval for all mechanical work.
Construction documents for buildings more than two stories in height shall indicate where
penetrations will be made for mechanical systems and the materials and methods for
maintaining required structural safety, fire-resistance rating and fireblocking.

Exceptions:
1. Workin 1 & 2 family dwellings and IRC townhouses.

2. The additional or relocation of not more than 15 diffusers connected to existing
HVAC equipment provided the work is limited to ducts and diffusers, the building
does not have a smoke control system, and duct do not penetrate a fire rated
assembly.

3. Inkind replacement of indoor or outdoor equipment.

15.05.325 Examination of documents.

The building official shall examine or cause to be examined the accompanying submittal
documents and shall ascertain by such examinations whether the construction indicated and
described is in accordance with the requirements of this code and other pertinent laws or
ordinances.

15.05.330 Use of Consultants.

Whenever review of a building permit application requires retention by the city for
professional consulting services, the applicant shall reimburse the city the full cost of such
professional consulting services. This fee shall be in addition to the normal plan review and
building permit fees. The city may require the applicant to deposit an amount with the city

Page 31 of 46

R:/CC/AAA Ordinances/Ord 583 Bldg & Constr Exhibit A



estimated in the discretion of the building official to be sufficient to cover anticipated costs for
retaining professional consultant services and to ensure reimbursement of such costs.

15.05.335 Expedited Plan Review.

At the time of application, an applicant may request that plans be sent to city approved
contract consultants, if the applicant believes that such review may expedite the plan review
process. The request must be in writing and acknowledge that the applicant agrees to pay the
full consultant fee, which is in addition to the normal plan review and building permit fees
collected by the city. The city may require the applicant to deposit with the city an amount
estimated by the city to be sufficient to cover anticipated costs for the expedited consultant
review and to ensure reimbursement of such costs.

15.05.340 Approval of construction documents.

When the building official issues a permit, the construction documents shall be
approved in writing or by stamp. One set of construction documents so reviewed shall be
retained by the city. The other set shall be returned to the applicant, shall be kept at the site of
work, and shall be open to inspection by the building official or a duly authorized
representative.

15.05.345 Phased approval.

The building official is authorized to issue a permit for the construction of foundations
or any other part of a building or structure before the construction documents for the whole
building or structure have been submitted, provided that adequate information and detailed
statements have been filed complying with pertinent requirements of this code. The holder of
such permit for the foundation or other parts of a building or structure shall proceed at the
holder’s own risk with the building operation and without assurance that a permit for the entire
structure will be granted. The city is authorized to require that a performance bond or other
security acceptable to the city be posted with the city in an amount equal to 150 percent of the
cost of demolition and removal of the work authorized under a phased approval. The security
shall be rescindable or refundable upon issuance of a building permit for the complete building
or structure and a request in writing for the refund. It shall be the duty of the applicant to
request a refund within 180 days of the permit issuance. Failure to request a refund within the
specified time period may result in forfeiture of the full amount.

15.05.350 Design professional in responsible charge.

When it is required that documents be prepared by a registered design professional,
the building official shall be authorized to require the owner to engage and designate on the
building permit application a registered design professional to act as the registered design
professional in responsible charge. If the circumstances require, the owner shall designate a
substitute registered design professional to perform the duties required of the original
registered design professional. The building official shall be notified in writing by the owner, if

Page 32 of 46

R:/CC/AAA Ordinances/Ord 583 Bldg & Constr Exhibit A



the registered design professional in responsible charge is changed or is unable to continue to
perform the duties.

The registered design professional in responsible charge shall be responsible for
reviewing and coordinating submittal documents prepared by others, including phased and
deferred submittal items, for compatibility with the design of the building. Where structural
observation is required by Chapter 17 IBC, the statement of special inspections shall name the
individual or firms who are to perform structural observation and describe the stages of
construction at which structural observation is to occur (see also duties specified in Section
1704 of the IBC).

At least one set of documents prepared by a registered design professional shall bear
the seal or stamp of the design professional and shall contain the original signature of the
design professional.

Exceptions:

1. Supporting documents such as engineering calculations, geotechnical reports,
and specifications need only bear an original stamp and signature on the cover
sheet of the supporting documents.

2. With permission of the building official, a copy of the original stamp and original
signature may be accepted on the documents.

15.05.355 Deferred submittals.

For the purposes of this section, deferred submittals are defined as those portions of
the design that are not submitted at the time of the application and that are to be submitted to
the building official within a specified period. Deferral of any submittal items shall have the
prior approval of the building official.

The registered design professional in responsible charge shall list the deferred
submittals on the construction documents for review by the building official. Documents for
deferred submittal items shall be submitted to the registered design professional in responsible
charge, who shall review them and forward them to the building official with a notation
indicating that the deferred submittal documents have been reviewed and found to be in
general conformance to the design of the building. The deferred submittal items shall not be
installed until the deferred submittal documents have been approved by the building official.
The city is authorized to charge an additional review fee to evaluate deferred submittals under
the provisions of this section.

15.05.360 Amended construction documents.

Work shall be installed in accordance with the approved construction documents, and any
changes made during construction that are not in compliance with the approved construction
documents shall be resubmitted for approval as an amended set of construction documents.
The building official may authorize minor field changes subject to the approval of the field
inspector. Where changes to the approved plans alter the size, shape, height, location or

Page 33 of 46

R:/CC/AAA Ordinances/Ord 583 Bldg & Constr Exhibit A



orientation on the property, major components of the structural load path, or exiting
requirements, a new permit application shall be submitted and applicable fee paid.

15.05.365 Retention of construction documents.

One set of approved construction documents shall be retained by the city for a period of
not less than 180 days from date of final inspection approval or permit expiration or as required
by state law.

15.05.370 Temporary structures and uses.

(2) General. The building official is authorized to issue a permit for temporary structures
and temporary uses. Such permits shall be limited as to time of service, but shall not be
permitted for more than 180 days. The building official is authorized to grant extensions for
demonstrated cause.

Exception: The building official may authorize unheated tents and yurts less than 500
square feet accommodating an R-1 occupancy for recreational use as a temporary
structure and allow them to be used indefinitely.

(2) Electrical. If the building official finds that the safety of life and property will not be
jeopardized, permits may be issued for temporary electrical installations for use during the
construction of buildings or for carnivals, conventions, festivals, fairs, the holding of religious
services, temporary lighting of streets, or other approved uses. Permission to use such
temporary installations shall not be granted for a length of time greater than ninety days,
except that a permit for a temporary installation to be used for constructing a building may be
issued for the period of construction. Where such temporary lighting is over the street area, the
proper authorization for such use of the street must first be obtained.

All such temporary installations shall be made in accordance with the requirements of
this code provided that the building official may permit deviations which will not permit
hazards to life or property, and further provided that, whenever such hazards are deemed by
the building official to exist, the building official may at once rescind or cancel the permit
covering such installation and disconnect, or order the disconnection of, all energy to such
equipment.

(3) Conformance. Temporary structures and uses shall conform to the structural strength,
fire safety, means of egress, accessibility, light, ventilation, and sanitary requirements of this
code, as necessary to ensure the public health, safety and welfare.

(4) Termination of approval. The building official is authorized to terminate such permit
for a temporary structure or use and to order the temporary structure or use to be
discontinued.

15.05.375 Fees.

Page 34 of 46

R:/CC/AAA Ordinances/Ord 583 Bldg & Constr Exhibit A



(1) Payment of fees. A permit shall not be valid until the fees prescribed by law have been
paid, nor shall an amendment to a permit be issued until the additional fee, if any, has been
paid.

(2) Schedule of permit fees. For buildings, gradings, demolitions and structures, and for
electrical, gas, mechanical, fire protection, and plumbing systems or alterations requiring a
permit, a fee for each permit shall be paid as required in accordance with this code and the fee
schedule adopted by resolution of the city council, as now or hereafter amended. In no case
shall the building permit fee be less than the city’s hourly inspection fee multiplied by the
number of inspections expected to be performed for work authorized by the permit. The city
manager is authorized to establish fees for any permit activity not specifically set forth herein.

(3) Plan Review Fees. When submittal documents are required, a plan review fee shall be
paid at the time of submitting the documents for plan review. The building official may have
the option to charge a deposit in lieu of the full plan review fee, if the full amount is not known
at the time. Any plan review deposit shall be applied toward the total plan review fee owed.
The actual permit fees and related plan review fee shall be determined upon completion of the
plan review, and the balance owing shall be paid at the time of permit issuance. The plan
review fee shall be a separate fee from the permit fees specified in this section and shall be in
addition to the permit fees. When submittal documents are incomplete or changed so as to
require additional plan review or when the project involves deferred submittal items, an
additional plan review fee may be charged. Any balance owing for plan review shall be paid
prior to any approval for extension of the permit application.

(4) Building permit valuations. The permit applicant shall provide an estimated permit
value at time of application. Permit valuation or valuation shall be as defined in BMC 15.05.020.
The final determination of value or valuation under any of the provisions of this code shall be
made by the building official.

(5) Work commencing before permit issuance. Any person who commences any work on a
building or structure or grading or on any gas, electrical, mechanical, fire protection or
plumbing system before obtaining the necessary permits shall be subject to a stop work order
and a special investigation fee in an amount equal to twice the permit fee. The special
investigation fee shall be in addition to the required permit fees.

When it is determined that construction has taken place that required a permit and
construction is at such a stage that structural conformance cannot be visually assured by the
building official, the owner shall comply with the following:

(a) As determined necessary by the building official the owner shall hire a licensed
registered design professional to submit a certified report as to the structural
integrity of the structure erected and the compliance of the structure with
applicable construction codes and regulations along with the building permit
application. This document (certification) must state any deficiencies and the
acceptable (code) corrective action.

(b) As determined necessary by the building official the owner shall secure building,
electrical, fire, plumbing and/or mechanical permits.

(c) As determined necessary by the building official the owner shall remove
construction materials in order to validate the systems have been installed correctly.

Page 35 of 46

R:/CC/AAA Ordinances/Ord 583 Bldg & Constr Exhibit A



(d) As determined necessary by the building official, the owner shall substantiate and/or
show proof of compliance with all applicable local, state and federal laws pertaining
to land use.

(e) As determined necessary by the building official, a site inspection and a life safety
inspection shall be obtained, when temporary occupancy approval or use of the
building or structure is needed prior to permit issuance and final inspection.

(6) Related fees. The payment of the fee for the construction, alteration, removal or
demolition of work done in connection to or concurrently with the work authorized by a
building permit shall not relieve the applicant or holder of the permit from the payment of
other fees that are prescribed by law.

(7) Refunds. The building official may authorize refunding not more than 80 percent of the
permit fee paid, when no work has been done under a permit issued in accordance with this
chapter. The building official may authorize refunding not more than 80 percent of the plan
review fee paid when an application for a permit for which a plan review fee has been paid, is
withdrawn or canceled before any plan review is done. The building official shall not authorize
refunding any fee paid except on written application filed by the original permittee not later
than 180 days after the date of fee payment.

15.05.380 Inspections.

Construction or work for which a permit is required shall be subject to inspection by the
building official, and such construction or work shall remain accessible and exposed for
inspection purposes until approved. Approval as a result of an inspection shall not be construed
to be an approval of a violation of the provisions of this code or of other ordinances of the city.
Inspections presuming to give authority to violate or cancel the provisions of this code or of
other ordinances of the city shall not be valid. It shall be the duty of the permit applicant to
cause the work to remain accessible and exposed for inspection purposes. Neither the building
official nor the city shall be liable for expense entailed in the removal or replacement of any
material as required to allow for inspection. Electrical systems and equipment regulated by the
Burien Electrical Code shall not be connected to the energy source until authorized by the
building official.

(1) Preliminary inspections. Before issuing a permit, the building official is authorized to
examine or cause to be examined buildings, structures and sites, for which an application has
been filed.

(2) Manufacturer’s installation instructions. Manufacturer’s installation instructions, as
required by this code, shall be available on the job site at the time of inspection.

(3) Required inspections. The building official, upon notification, shall make the following
inspections:

(a) Temporary erosion and sediment control inspection. Temporary erosion and
sediment control inspections shall be made after all required silt fencing,
construction fencing, straw bales, storm drain catch basin inserts (socks), entrance
rocking, and other required elements are in place and prior to commencement of
construction and/or clearing the site.

Page 36 of 46

R:/CC/AAA Ordinances/Ord 583 Bldg & Constr Exhibit A



(b) Footing and foundation inspection. Footing and foundation inspections shall be
made after poles or piers are set, trenches or basement areas are excavated, or
excavations for footings are complete, any forms erected, and all required hold-
down anchor bolts, hold-down straps, and any required reinforcing steel is in place
and supported. The foundation inspection shall include excavations for thickened
slabs intended for the support of bearing walls, partitions, structural supports, or
equipment. Foundation inspections shall also include special requirements for wood
foundations and for any setbacks required from a property line, building setback
line, critical area buffer, and/or the ordinary high water mark on waterfront
properties. For concrete foundations, any required forms shall be in place prior to
inspection. Materials for the foundation shall be on the job except that where
concrete is ready-mixed in accordance with ASTM C 94, the concrete need not be on
the job.

(c) Concrete slab and under-floor inspection. Concrete slab and under-floor
inspections shall be made after in-slab or under-floor reinforcing steel and building
service equipment, conduit, slab insulation, piping accessories, and other ancillary
equipment items are in place, but before any concrete is placed or floor sheathing
installed, including the subfloor.

(d) Electrical Underground. Underground inspection shall be made after trenches or
ditches are excavated and bedded and piping and conductors are installed and
before backfill is put in place. Where excavated soil contains rocks, broken concrete,
frozen chunks or other rubble that would damage or break the raceway, cable or
conductors, or where corrosive action will occur, protection shall be provided in the
form of granular or selected material, approved running boards, sleeves, or other
means.

(e) Lowest floor elevation. In flood hazard areas, upon placement of the lowest floor,
including the basement, and prior to further vertical construction, the elevation
certification required in IBC Section 1612.5 or IRC Section R322 and BMC 15.55 shall
be submitted to the building official. FEMA flood elevation certificates shall contain
an original stamp and signature of the surveyor, licensed by the State of
Washington, and shall document the elevation of the lowest floor, including
basement, and other information required by the flood elevation certificate.

(f) Exterior wall sheathing inspection. Exterior wall sheathing shall be inspected after
all wall framing is complete and strapping and nailing is properly installed but prior
to being covered.

(g) Roof sheathing inspection. The roof sheathing shall be inspected after all roof
framing is complete. No roof coverings shall be installed until inspections are made
and approved and confirmation that the height of the structure is in conformance
with the requirements of the city of Burien zoning code and/or shoreline master
program.

(h) IMC/UPC/GAS/ rough- in inspection. Rough in mechanical, gas piping, plumbing,
and electrical shall be inspected when the rough in work is complete and, if

Page 37 of 46

R:/CC/AAA Ordinances/Ord 583 Bldg & Constr Exhibit A



required, under test. No connections to primary utilities shall be made until the
rough in work is inspected and approved.

(i) Electrical rough-in inspection. Rough-in inspection shall be made after the roof,
framing, fireblocking and bracing are in place and all wiring and other components
to be concealed are complete and prior to the installation of wall or ceiling
membranes. All required equipment grounding conductors installed in concealed
cable or flexible conduit systems must be completely installed and made up at the
time of the rough-in cover inspection.

(j) Frame inspection. Framing inspections shall be made after the roof deck, wall
sheathing, all framing, fire blocking, and bracing are in place, pipes, chimneys and
vents to be concealed are complete, the rough electrical, plumbing, fire suppression
piping, heating wires, pipes, and ducts are approved, and the building is substantially
dried in.

(k) Flashing and exterior weather barrier inspection. Flashing and exterior weather
barrier inspections shall be made after flashing and weather barrier materials have
been installed but prior to any of the work being covered. Subject to the approval of
the building official, an approved special inspection agency may be utilized for these
inspections during the course of construction. In addition to these requirements,
multi-unit structures as defined in RCW 64.55.010 shall comply with the special
inspection and documentation requirements of RCW 64.55.020.

Exception: Groups R-3 and One- and Two-Family Dwellings are exempt from this
inspection.

(I) Exterior Finish and Insulation Systems (EFIS), lath and gypsum board inspection.
EFIS, lath and gypsum board inspections shall be made after backing, lathing or
gypsum board, interior and exterior, is in place, but before any plastering is applied
or gypsum board joints and fasteners are taped and finished.

Exception: Interior gypsum board that is not part of a fire-resistance rated
assembly or a shear assembly and is located in Aircraft Noise Reduction Zone 3
(Twenty-five dB).

(m)Fire and smoke resistant penetrations. Protection of joints and penetrations in fire-
resistance-rated assemblies, smoke barriers, and smoke partitions shall not be
concealed from view until inspected and approved.

(n) Energy efficiency inspection. In addition to the inspections required in WAC 51-11,
the following inspections are also required:

(i.) Envelope

1. Wall Insulation: To be made after all wall insulation and air vapor retarder
sheet or film materials are in place, but before any wall covering is placed.

Glazing: To be made after glazing materials are installed in the building.

Exterior Roofing Insulation: To be made after the installation of the roof
insulation, but before concealment.

Page 38 of 46

R:/CC/AAA Ordinances/Ord 583 Bldg & Constr Exhibit A



4. Slab/Floor Insulation: To be made after the installation of the slab/floor
insulation, but before concealment.

(ii.) Mechanical

1. Mechanical Equipment Efficiency and Economizer: To be made after all
equipment and controls required by the construction codes are installed and
prior to the concealment of such equipment or controls.

2. Mechanical Pipe and Duct Insulation: To be made after all pipe, fire
suppression piping, and duct insulation is in place, but before concealment.

(iii.) Lighting and Motors
1. Lighting Equipment and Controls: To be made after the installation of all

lighting equipment and controls required by the construction codes, but
before concealment of the lighting equipment.

2. Motors: To be made after installation of all equipment covered by the
construction codes, but before concealment.

(o) Final inspection. The final inspection shall be made after all work required by the
permit is completed. If located in a flood hazard area, documentation of the
elevation of the lowest floor as required in IBC Section 1612.5 or IRC Section R322
and Chapter 15.55 BMC shall be submitted to the building official prior to the final
inspection.

(4) Reinspection. The building official may require a structure or portions of work to be re-
inspected A reinspection fee shall be permitted to be assessed for each inspection or
reinspection, when such portion of work for which inspection is called is not complete; or when
required corrections have not been made; or when the approved plans and permit are not on
site in a conspicuous or pre-approved location; or when the building is not accessible. This
provision is not to be interpreted as requiring reinspection fees the first time a job is rejected
for failure to comply with the requirements of this code, but as controlling the practice of
calling for inspections before the job is ready for inspection or reinspection. In instances where
re-inspection fees have been assessed, no additional inspection of the work will be performed
until the required fees have been paid.

(5) Other inspections. In addition to the inspections specified above, the building official is
authorized to make or require other inspections of any construction work to ascertain
compliance with the provisions of this code and other laws that are enforced by the building
department.

(6) Special inspections. In addition to the inspections noted above, the building official is
authorized to require special inspections for any type of work related to the construction codes
by an inspection agency approved by the building official at no cost to the city.

The building official may require special inspection of equipment or wiring methods,
when the installation requires special training, equipment, expertise, or knowledge. When such
special inspection is required, it shall be performed by an independent third party acceptable to
the building official. The special inspection person/agency shall be designated and approved
prior to beginning the installation of wiring or equipment. A written report from the designated

Page 39 of 46

R:/CC/AAA Ordinances/Ord 583 Bldg & Constr Exhibit A



special inspection agency, indicating that the installation conforms to the appropriate codes
and standards shall be received by the building official prior to that installation being approved.
All costs for such testing and reporting shall be the responsibility of the permit holder.

Multi-unit structures as defined in RCW 64.55.010 shall comply with the special
inspection requirements as listed in RCW 64.55.030. Upon completion of an inspection required
by RCW 64.55.030, the qualified inspector shall prepare and submit to the appropriate building
department a signed letter certifying that the building enclosure has been inspected during the
course of construction or rehabilitative construction and that it has been constructed or
reconstructed in substantial compliance with the building enclosure design documents, as
updated pursuant to RCW 64.55.020. The building department shall not issue a final certificate
of occupancy or other equivalent final acceptance until the letter required by this section has
been submitted. The building department is not charged with and has no responsibility for
determining whether the building enclosure inspection is adequate or appropriate to satisfy the
requirements of this chapter.

(7) Inspection agencies. The building official is authorized to accept reports of approved
inspection agencies, provided such agencies satisfy the applicable requirements as to
qualifications and reliability.

(8) Inspection requests. It shall be the duty of the holders of the permits or their duly
authorized agent to notify the city when work is ready for inspection. It shall be the duty of the
permit holders to provide access to and means for inspections of such work that are required
by this code.

(9) Approval required. Work shall not be done beyond the point indicated in each
successive inspection without first obtaining the approval of the building official. The building
official, upon notification, shall make the requested inspections and shall either indicate the
portion of the construction that is satisfactory as completed or notify the permit holder or his
or her agent that the same fails to comply with this code. Any portions that do not comply shall
be corrected and such portion shall not be covered or concealed until authorized by the
building official.

15.05.385 Traffic management systems.

(1) The city building official will perform the electrical inspection and acceptance of traffic
management systems within its jurisdiction. A traffic management system includes:

(a) Traffic illumination systems;
(b) Traffic signal systems;
(c) Traffic monitoring systems;

(d) The electrical service cabinet and all related components and equipment installed on
the load side of the service cabinet supplying electrical power to the traffic
management system; and

(e) Signalization system(s) necessary for the operation of a light rail system. A traffic
management system can provide signalization for controlling vehicular traffic,
pedestrian traffic, or rolling stock.

Page 40 of 46

R:/CC/AAA Ordinances/Ord 583 Bldg & Constr Exhibit A


http://apps.leg.wa.gov/rcw/default.aspx?cite=64.55.020

(2) The city recognizes that traffic signal conductors, pole and bracket cables, signal
displays, traffic signal controllers/cabinets, and associated components used in traffic
management systems are acceptable for the purpose of meeting the requirements of chapter
19.28 RCW, provided they conform with the following standards or are listed on the
Washington State Department of Transportation (WSDOT) qualified products list:

(a) WSDOT/APWA Standard Specifications and Plans;

(b) WSDOT Design Manual;

(c) International Municipal Signal Association (IMSA);

(d) National Electrical Manufacturer's Association (NEMA);

(e) Federal Standards 170/Controller Cabinets;

(f) Manual for Uniform Road, Bridge, and Municipal Construction;
(g) Institute of Transportation Engineers (ITE); or

(h) Manual of Uniform Traffic Control Devices (MUTCD).

(3) Associated induction detection loop or similar circuits will be accepted by the city
without inspection.

(4) For the licensing requirements of Chapter 19.28 RCW, jurisdictions will be considered
owners of traffic management systems when doing electrical work for another jurisdiction(s)
under a valid interlocal agreement, as permitted by Chapter 39.34 RCW. Interlocal agreements
for traffic management systems must be filed with the city prior to work being performed for
this provision to apply.

(5) Jurisdictions with an established electrical inspection authority and WSDOT may
perform electrical inspection on their rights of way for each other by interlocal agreement. They
may not perform electrical inspection on other rights of way except as allowed in 19.28 or
39.34 RCW.

(6) Underground installations.

(a) In other than open trenching, raceways will be considered "fished" according to the
NEC and do not require visual inspection.
(b) The city will conduct inspections in open trenching within its jurisdiction upon
request.
(7) Identification of traffic management system components. Local government
jurisdictions or WSDOT may act as the certifying authority for the safety evaluation of all
components.
(a) An electrical service cabinet must contain only listed components. The electrical
service cabinet enclosure is not required to be listed but will conform to the
standards in subsection (8) of this section.

(b) The local government jurisdiction must identify, as acceptable, the controller cabinet
or system component(s) with an identification plate. The identification plate must be
located inside the cabinet and may be attached with adhesive.

(8) Conductors of different circuits in same cable, enclosure, or raceway. All traffic
management system circuits will be permitted to occupy the same cable, enclosure, or raceway

Page 41 of 46

R:/CC/AAA Ordinances/Ord 583 Bldg & Constr Exhibit A



without regard to voltage characteristics, provided all conductors are insulated for the
maximum voltage of any conductor in the cable, enclosure, or raceway.

15.05.390 Certificate of occupancy.

(2) Use and occupancy. No building or structure shall be used or occupied, and no change
in the existing occupancy classification of a building or structure or portion thereof shall be
made until the building official has issued a certificate of occupancy therefore as provided
herein. Issuance of a certificate of occupancy shall not be construed as an approval of a
violation of the provisions of this code or of other ordinances of the city.

Exception: Work exempt from permits per BMC 15.05.245.

(2) Certificate issued. After the building official inspects the building or structure and finds
no violations of the provisions of this code or other laws that are enforced by the building
department, the building official shall issue a certificate of occupancy that contains the
following information:

(a) The permit number.

(b) The address of the structure.

(c) The name and address of the owner.

(d) A description of that portion of the structure for which the certificate is issued.

(e) A statement that the described portion of the structure has been inspected for
compliance with the requirements of this code for the occupancy and division of
occupancy and the use for which the proposed occupancy is classified.

(f) The name of the building official.

(g) The edition of the code under which the permit was issued.

(h) The use and occupancy.

(i) The type of construction.

(j) The design occupant load.

(k) Whether an automatic sprinkler system is provided and whether the sprinkler
system is required.

(I) Any special stipulations and conditions of the building permit.

Exception: Single-family dwellings and their accessory structures approved under the
International Residential Code and group U occupancies associated with Single Family
residences approved under the International Building Code may be issued a certificate
of occupancy in the form of a signed off permit inspection card.

(3) Temporary or phased occupancy. The building official is authorized to issue a
temporary or phased certificate of occupancy before the completion of the entire work covered
by the permit, provided that such portion or portions shall be occupied safely. The building
official is authorized to require in addition to the completion of life safety building components,
the completion of any or all accessibility components prior to issuance of a temporary or
phased certificate of occupancy. The building official shall set a time period during which the
temporary or phased certificate of occupancy is valid. The city is authorized to require that a

Page 42 of 46

R:/CC/AAA Ordinances/Ord 583 Bldg & Constr Exhibit A



performance bond or other security acceptable to the city be provided with the city in an
amount equal to 150% of the value of incomplete work as determined by the design
professional. The security shall be rescindable or refundable upon issuance of a final certificate
of occupancy for the complete building or structure and a request in writing for the refund. It
shall be the duty of the applicant to request a refund within 180 days of the issuance of the
certificate of occupancy. Failure to request a refund within the specified time period may result
in forfeiture of the full amount.

(4) Revocation. The building official is authorized to, in writing, suspend or revoke a
certificate of occupancy or completion issued under the provisions of this code wherever the
certificate is issued in error, or on the basis of incorrect information supplied by the owner or
owner’s representatives, or where it is determined that the building or structure or portion
thereof is in violation of any ordinance or regulation or any of the provisions of this code. This
section shall be applied, implemented and interpreted consistent with the statutes and court
decisions of the State of Washington.

15.05.395 Service utilities.

(1) Connection of service utilities. No person shall make connections from a utility or
source of energy, fuel or power to any building or system that is regulated by this code for
which a permit is required, until authorized by the building official.

(2) Temporary connection. The building official shall have the authority to authorize the
temporary connection of the building or system to the utility source of energy, fuel or power.

(3) Authority to disconnect service utilities. The building official shall have the authority to
authorize disconnection of utility service to the building, structure or system regulated by this
code and the referenced codes and standards set forth in this code in case of emergency, when
necessary to eliminate an immediate hazard to life or property, or when such utility connection
has been made without the required approval. The building official shall notify the serving
utility, and whenever possible the owner and occupant of the building, structure or service
system of the decision to disconnect prior to taking such action. If not notified prior to
disconnecting, the owner or occupant of the building, structure or service system shall be
notified in writing, as soon as practical thereafter.

15.05.400 Appeals

(1) General. Appeals of final orders, decisions, or determinations made by the building
official relative to the application and interpretation of Title 15 and the adopted codes may be
appealed by the permit applicant, property owner or his/her agent to the hearing examiner,
pursuant to Chapters 2.15 and 2.20 BMC, within 30 days of the issuance of the final order,
decision or determination.

(2) Limitations on authority. An application for appeal shall be based on a claim that the
true intent of this title or the rules adopted thereunder have been incorrectly interpreted, the
provisions of this title do not fully apply or an equally good or better form of construction is
proposed. The hearing examiner shall have no authority to waive requirements of this title.

Page 43 of 46

R:/CC/AAA Ordinances/Ord 583 Bldg & Constr Exhibit A


http://www.codepublishing.com/wa/burien/html/Burien02/Burien0215.html#2.15
http://www.codepublishing.com/wa/burien/html/Burien02/Burien0220.html#2.20

(3) Participation in the appeal. Only those parties who have appealed the building official’s
final order, decision or determination may participate in the appeal in either or both of the
following ways:

(a) By submitting written comments or testimony to the hearing examiner prior to
commencement of the hearing; or

(b) By appearing in person, or through a representative at the hearing. The hearing
examiner may reasonably limit the extent of oral testimony or oral argument to
facilitate the orderly and timely conduct of the hearing.

(4) Decision on the appeal. The hearing examiner shall consider all information and material
within the scope of the appeal submitted by persons entitled to participate in the appeal.
Based on the hearing examiner’s findings and conclusions, the hearing examiner may
affirm, reverse or modify the order, decision or determination being appealed. The hearing
examiner’s decision on the appeal shall be issued within 90 days from the date the original
appeal period closed, unless all parties to an appeal have agreed to an extended time
period. Within four business days after it is issued, the hearing examiner’s decision shall be
mailed to the applicant and to each person who has requested notice of the decision. The
hearing examiner’s final decision shall be the final decision of the city on the appeal and
shall be conclusive unless proceedings for review of the decision are properly commenced
in superior court within the time period specified by state law.

(5) Judicial review. Any judicial appeal of the hearing examiner’s decision shall be reviewed in
King County superior court pursuant to Chapter 36.70C RCW, the Land Use Petition Act
(“LUPA”). The land use petition must be filed within twenty-one calendar days of the
issuance of the hearing examiner’s decision.

15.05.405 Unlawful Acts.

It shall be unlawful for any person, firm or corporation to erect, construct, alter, extend,
repair, move, remove, demolish or occupy any building, structure, property or equipment
regulated by this title, or cause the same to be done, in conflict with or in violation of any of the
provisions of this title. Signs, tags or seals posted or affixed by the building official shall not be
mutilated, destroyed or tampered with or removed without authorization from the building
official.

15.05.410 Violations — Penalties

The violation of or failure to comply with any provision of this chapter is declared to be
unlawful and subject to enforcement as set forth in Chapter 1.15 BMC.

15.05.415 Stop work order.

(2) Authority. Whenever the building official finds any work being performed in a manner
either contrary to the provisions of this code, the construction codes, or other pertinent laws
or ordinances that are violated during the course of work authorized by the permit, the building

Page 44 of 46

R:/CC/AAA Ordinances/Ord 583 Bldg & Constr Exhibit A



official is authorized to issue a stop work order. Issuance of a notice of violation, infraction or
notice and order is not a condition precedent to the issuance of the stop work order.

(2) Issuance. The stop work order shall be in writing and shall be given to the owner of the
property involved, or to the owner’s agent, or to the person doing the work and posted in plain
site on the premises, structure, fixture, or system as applicable. Upon issuance of a stop work
order, the cited work shall immediately cease. The stop work order shall state the reason for
the order and the conditions under which the cited work will be permitted to resume.

(3) Effect.

(a) The building official is authorized to assess a special investigation fee for the
issuance of a stop work order, when work has started without the issuance of a
permit. The special investigation fee shall be determined in accordance with
15.05.375 (5) BMC, “Work commencing before permit issuance.”

(b) A stop work order represents a determination that a code violation has occurred
and that any work or activity that is causing or contributing to the violation on the
property where the violation has occurred or is occurring must cease.

(c) A stop work order requires the immediate cessation of the specified work or activity
on the named property. Work or activity may not resume unless specifically
authorized by the building official or designee.

(d) A stop work order may be appealed to the city hearing examiner according to the
procedures prescribed by 15.05.400 BMC, “Appeals.”

(e) Failure to appeal the stop work order within the applicable time limits shall render
the stop work order a final determination that a code violation occurred and that
work was properly ordered to cease.

(f) Failure to comply with the terms of a stop work is declared to be unlawful and
subject to enforcement as provided in BMC 1.15.110.

15.05.420 Unsafe structures and equipment.

(1) General. Structures or existing equipment which are or hereafter become unsafe,
unsanitary or deficient because of inadequate means of egress facilities or inadequate light and
ventilation, which constitute a fire hazard, are otherwise dangerous to human life or the public
welfare, or that involve illegal or improper occupancy or inadequate maintenance, shall be
deemed an unsafe condition. Additionally, a structure that is not secured against entry or which
has been abandoned for more than one year or for which the applicant or owner fails to
request the required inspection(s) prior to permit expiration or occupancy may be deemed
unsafe by the building official.

(2) Evacuation. Where conditions exist that are deemed hazardous to life and property, the
building official is authorized to abate summarily such hazardous conditions that are in violation
of the codes. The building official shall be authorized to order the immediate evacuation of any
unsafe occupied building when such building has hazardous conditions that present imminent
danger to building occupants. Persons so notified shall immediately leave the structure or
premises and shall not enter or re-enter until authorized to do so by the building official.

Page 45 of 46

R:/CC/AAA Ordinances/Ord 583 Bldg & Constr Exhibit A



(3) Abatement. Where a structure has been deemed unsafe, the building official or
designee shall first issue a civil notice of violation as prescribed in BMC 1.15.120. The notice of
violation shall include a statement requiring the unsafe structure or equipment to be taken
down and removed or made safe, as the building official deems necessary and as provided for
in Chapter 15.40 BMC “Burien Building and Property Maintenance Code.”

15.05.425 Copies to be available.

(1) A copy of each code adopted by reference in this title shall be authenticated and
recorded by the city clerk.

(2) The codes, standards, rules, and regulations adopted by this title are adopted by
reference thereto as though fully set forth in this title. Not less than one copy of each such
code, standards, rules, and regulations, in the form in which it was adopted and suitably
marked to indicate amendments, additions, deletions, and exceptions as provided in this title,
shall be filed in the building official’s office and be available for use and examination by the
public.

Page 46 of 46

R:/CC/AAA Ordinances/Ord 583 Bldg & Constr Exhibit A



Exhibit B

Chapter 15.10 CONSTRUCTION CODES

Sections:
15.10.010 Short title.
15.10.020 Purpose.
15.10.030 Sound and hours of construction.
15.10.040 Referenced codes.
15.10.050 Code conflicts resolution.
15.10.060 International Building Code adopted.
15.10.070 International Residential Code adopted.
15.10.080 International Mechanical code adopted.
15.10.090 National Fuel Gas Code (NFPA 54) adopted.
15.10.100 Liquefied Petroleum Gas Code (NFPA 58) adopted.
15.10.110 International Fuel Gas Code adopted.
15.10.120  Uniform Plumbing Code adopted.

15.10.130 Washington-State—Energy-International Energy Conservation
Code adopted.

15.10.140 Burien Electrical Code adopted.

15.10.010 Short title.

This chapter is known as and may be referred to as the “city of Burien Building and
Construction Code” and may be cited as such.

15.10.020 Purpose.

The purpose of the codes and regulations adopted by this title is to promote the health,
safety, and welfare of the occupants or users of buildings and structures and the general public,
by the provision of construction codes throughout the city and not to create or otherwise
establish or designate any particular class or group of persons who will or should be especially
protected by the terms of these codes and regulations. More specifically, this chapter is
designed to effectuate the following purposes, objectives and standards:

(1) To set forth minimum performance standards and requirements for construction and
construction materials, consistent with nationally accepted standards of engineering and fire
and life safety.

(2)  To permit the use of current technical methods, devices and improvements.

(3) To eliminate restrictive, obsolete, conflicting, duplicative and unnecessary regulations
and requirements which could unnecessarily increase construction costs or retard the use of

new materials and methods of installation or provide unwarranted preferential treatment to
types or classes of materials or products or methods of construction.

(4) To provide standards and specifications for making buildings and facilities accessible to
and usable by physically challenged persons.



(5) To consolidate the administration and enforcement of building and construction codes.

15.10.030 Sound and hours of construction.

Sounds originating from construction sites, including but not limited to sound from
construction equipment, power tools and hammering, are prohibited between the hours of
10:00 p.m. to 7:00 a.m. on weekdays and 10:00 p.m. to 9:00 a.m. on weekends, as regulated in
BMC 9.105.400.

15.10.040 Referenced codes.

Specific codes referenced in the general codes adopted by this chapter shall be as
follows:

(1) Any and all reference to the International Plumbing Code shall be replaced with the
Uniform Plumbing Code as adopted in BMC 15.10.120.

(2) Any and all reference to the International Property Maintenance Code shall be replaced
with the Burien Building and Property Maintenance Code as adopted in Chapter 15.40 BMC.

(3) Any and all reference to the International Electrical Code, National Electrical Code or
NFPA 70 shall be replaced with the Burien Electrical Code as adopted in BMC 15.10.140.

15.10.050 Code conflicts resolution.

(1) The codes enumerated in Title 15 BMC are adopted by the State Building Code Council
as provided in RCW 19.27.074 and amended by the State Building Code Council from time to
time, and are enacted by the State Legislature.

The State Legislature mandates, as provided in RCW 19.27.050, that all counties and
cities throughout the state shall enforce the codes and all amendments thereto. Therefore, the
city of Burien automatically adopts by reference these codes and their respective amendments
as they are adopted and amended by the State Legislature.

2) In case of conflict among the International Building Code, the International Residential
Code, the International Mechanical Code, the International Fire Code and the Uniform
Plumbing Code, the first named code shall govern over those following.

(3) In case of conflict between other codes and provisions adopted by this chapter, the
code or provision that is the most restrictive, as determined by the building official, shall apply.

\[A1]15.10.060 International Building Code adopted.

The 2009-2012 Edition of the International Building Code (IBC), as published by the
International Code Council, Inc. and as adopted by the State Building Code Council in Chapter
51-50 WAC, and including Appendix Chapter E (Accessibility), ICC A117.1-2003-2009 (Accessible
Standards), Appendix Chapter H (signs), and Appendix Chapter J (Grading), excluding Chapter 1,
Administration, is herby adopted by reference, together with the amendments set forth in this
section. The Construction Administrative Code, as set forth in Chapter 15.05 BMC, shall be used
in place of IBC Chapter 1, Administration.

Page 2 of 17

R:/CC/AAA Ordinances/Ord 583 Bldg & Constr Exhibit B



(1) The 2009-2012 International Existing Building Code (IEBC) is included in the adoption of
this code in Section 34845 3401.6 and amended in WAC 51-50-480000, excluding Chapter 1,
Part 2 — Administration. The Construction Administrative Code as set forth in Chapter 15.05
BMC shall be used in place of IEBC Chapter 1, Part 2 — Administration.

2 The provisions of this code do not apply to temporary growing structures used solely for
the commercial production of horticultural plants including ornamental plants, flowers,
vegetables, and fruits. "Temporary growing structure" means a structure that has the sides and
roof covered with polyethylene, polyvinyl, or similar flexible synthetic material and is used to
provide plants with either frost protection or increased heat retention. A temporary growing
structure is not considered a building for purposes of this code.

(3) The provisions of this code do not apply to the construction, alteration, or repair of
temporary worker housing, except as provided by rule adopted under Chapter 70.114A RCW or
Chapter 37, Laws of 1998 (SB 6168). "Temporary worker housing" means a place, area, or piece
of land where sleeping places or housing sites are provided by an employer for his or her
employees or by another person, including a temporary worker housing operator, who is
providing such accommodations for employees, for temporary, seasonal occupancy, and
includes "labor camps" under RCW 70.54.110.

4) The provisions of this code do not apply to Vendor Carts. “Vendor cart” means a mobile,
portable means of containing or transporting merchandise, vegetables, fruits, or other
inventory for the purpose of retail sales. “Vendor cart” shall not mean a building or structure,
as defined in this code. Unless otherwise exempted, separate plumbing, electrical and
mechanical permits shall be required.
(5) Add new stand-alone section as follows:
Design Criteria shall be as follows:

GROUND AND ROOF SNOW LOAD: 25 PSF

SEISMIC DESIGN CATEGORY: D

WIND SPEED: 70 mph sustained with 85 mph 3 sec. gust

WIND EXPOSURE: Site Specific. See IBC Section 1609.4

SOIL BEARING: Site specific. See IBC Chapter 18

WEATHERING: Moderate

FROST LINE DEPTH: 12 inches

TERMITE: Slight to moderate

DECAY: Slight to moderate

WINTER DESIGN TEMPERATURE: 24°F

SUMMER DESIGN TEMPERATURE: 83°F

ICE SHIELD UNDERLAYMENT REQUIRED: No

FLOOD HAZARDS: See BMC 15.55

AIR FREEZING INDEX: 148°F- days

Page 3 of 17

R:/CC/AAA Ordinances/Ord 583 Bldg & Constr Exhibit B



| MEAN ANNUAL TEMPERATURE: 51.4 °F.

#(6)  Amend IBC Section 403-4-7-1403.4.8.1 Special requirements for standby power systems
to read as follows:

403-4-7-1403.4.8.1 Special requirements for standby power systems. If the
standby system is a generator set inside a building, the system shall be located
in a separate room enclosed with 2-hour fire barriers constructed in
accordance with Section 403-4- 731 and 707 or horizontal assemblies
constructed in accordance with Section 742711, or both, 'andl[As] shall be in a
separate room from the normal power source including transformers and
distribution equipment. Power distribution from the emergency source to the
emergency transfer switch shall be by an independent route from the normal
power source. System supervision with manual start and transfer features shall
be provided at the fire command center. Fuel-fired standby power generator
sets and associated fuel storage, including optional landlord- or tenant-owned

generator sets, located more than 75 feet above the lowest level of Fire

Department vehicle access, require the approval of the fire code official.

{8)(7) _Add new IBC Section 403-4-713403.4.8.1.1 Penetrations, to read as follows:

403-4-71-1403.4.8.1.1 Penetrations. Penetrations into and openings through a room
containing a standby power system are prohibited except for required exit doors,
equipment and ductwork necessary for heating, cooling or ventilation, sprinkler branch
line piping, or electrical raceway serving the standby power system or being served by
the standby power system. Such penetrations shall be protected in accordance with
Section 743-714.

Exception: Metallic piping with no joints or openings where it passes

through the standby power system room.

| {9)(8) Amend IBC Section 403-4-72403.4.8.2 Standby power loads to add a fourth item to
read as follows:

Page 4 of 17

R:/CC/AAA Ordinances/Ord 583 Bldg & Constr Exhibit B



403.4.7.2403.4.8.2 Standby power loads. The following are classified as standby power
loads:

1. Power and lighting for the fire command center required by Section
403-4-5403.4.6;

2. Ventilation and automatic fire detection equipment for smokeproof
enclosures;

3. Standby power shall be provided for elevators in accordance with Sections
1007.4, 3003, 3007 and 3008: and

4. Smoke control systems.

0)(9) Add new IBC Section 403.7, Smoke control, and amend to read as follows:

403.7 Smoke control. A smoke control system meeting the requirements of Section 909
shall be provided in buildings having floors more than 75 feet above the lowest level of
fire department vehicle access.

(21(10)Amend IBC Section 405.8, Standby power, as follows: Add the following sentence to the
end of the paragraph:

405.8 Standby power. A standby power system complying with Chapter 27 shall be
provided standby power loads specified in Section 405.8.1. Fuel-fired emergency
generator sets and associated fuel storage, including optional generator sets, located
more than 30 feet below the lowest level of exit discharge require the approval of the
fire code official.

(2)(11)Amend IBC Table 508.4 Required Separation of Occupancies (Hours) as follows:
Add footnote reference superscript “g=—“e”to R and—greup—-+ Occupancy

o N ou,n

Classification row and column headings. Add footnote “g~ “e”. to read: See Section 419

for Live/Work Unit separations. See—Section—420—for Dwelling—Unitseparation
recuirernenis:

o“u_n

Add footnote reference superscript “a” to I-1 Occupancy.

Page 5 of 17

R:/CC/AAA Ordinances/Ord 583 Bldg & Constr Exhibit B



(15)(12)Amend IBC Section 903.2 Automatic sprinkler systems to read as follows:

903.2 Where required. Approved automatic sprinkler systems in new buildings and
structures shall be provided in the locations described in Sections 903.2.1 through
903.2.12, WAC 51-50-903 and in all buildings with a gross area of 5,000 square feet or
greater, regardless of type or use.
Exceptions: Spaces or areas in telecommunications buildings used exclusively
for telecommunications equipment, associated electrical power distribution
equipment, batteries and standby engines, provided those spaces or areas are
equipped throughout with an automatic smoke detection system in accordance
with Section 907.2 and are separated from the remainder of the building by not
less than 1-hour fire barriers constructed in accordance with Section 707 or not
less than 2-hour horizontal assemblies constructed in accordance with Section
#2711, or both.

For the purposes of this section, fire walls as specified in Section706 of the
International Building Code shall not be used to reduce the calculation of floor areas of
this chapter.

Page 6 of 17

R:/CC/AAA Ordinances/Ord 583 Bldg & Constr Exhibit B



(73(13) Amend IBC Section 907.1.3, Equipment, as follows: Add the following sentence to the
end of the paragraph:

907.1.3 Equipment. Systems and their components shall be listed and approved for the
purpose for which they are installed. All new alarm systems shall be addressable. Each
device shall have its own address and shall annunciate individual addresses at the
approved supervising station.

(18)(14)Add new IBC Section 907.2.24, System Installation, to read as follows:

907.2.24 System installation. Fire alarm systems shall be installed and maintained in
accordance with this code by persons under the direct supervision of individuals that
have factory training and certification on the system being installed. Plans submitted for
Fire Alarm System permits shall be prepared under the supervision of individuals
possessing a NICET (National Institute for Certification in Engineering Technologies)
Level Il certification in Fire Alarm Systems or shall be licensed by the State of
Washington as a Professional Fire Protection or Electrical Engineer or certified by the
State of Washington. Plans shall identify certification and/or licensing information.

(19)(15)Add new IBC Section 911.1.2.1, Penetrations, to read as follows:

911.1.2.1 Penetrations. Penetrations into and openings through a fire command
center are prohibited except for required exit doors, equipment and ductwork
necessary for heating, cooling or ventilation, sprinkler branch line piping, electrical
raceway for fire department communication and control, and electrical raceways
serving the fire command center or being controlled from the fire command center.
Such penetrations shall be protected in accordance with Section 713.

Exception: Metallic piping with no joints or openings.

| (20)(16)Amend IBC Section 1503.4 roof drainage to revise reference to the Uniform Plumbing
code and add new section 1503.4.4, Discharge and Disposal to read as follows:

[P] 1503.4 Roof drainage. Design and installation of roof drainage systems shall comply
’With‘[A?] IBC Section 1503 and Chapter 11 of the Uniform Plumbing Code.

1503.4.4 Discharge and Disposal. Roof top drainage shall be disposed of by one of
the following methods:

1. Tight line to a storm water system (private or public).

Page 7 of 17

R:/CC/AAA Ordinances/Ord 583 Bldg & Constr Exhibit B



2. Tight line to a roof-runoff infiltration system.
3. Concrete splash blocks.

1503.4.4.1 Tight line. A tight line with direct discharge to an abutting
property or the right-of-way is prohibited unless specifically approved by the
building official on the construction plans/permit.

1503.4.4.2 Review Required. In all cases the method selected shall be
subject to review and approval by the building official and/or the city Public
Works Department, with consideration given to site, soil types, slope condition
and the nature of the development.

1503.4.4.3 Standards. All drainage systems both public and private shall be
designed in accordance with storm water standards adopted by the city of
Burien.

1503.4.4.4  “Green Roof technology”. “Green roof” technology may be
approved by the building official provided that any drainage coming off of the
roof is collected and disposed of pursuant to Sec 1503.4.4.1.

213(17)Amend IBC Section 1608.1, General, to read as follows:
1608.1 General. Design snow loads shall be not less than 25 PSF uniform roof snow
load, nor less than that determined by IBC Section 1607.
| {22)(18)Amend IBC Section 1612.3, Establishment of flood hazard areas.1612.3, to read as
follows:

1612.3 Establishment of flood hazard areas. To establish flood hazard areas, the
applicable governing authority shall adopt a flood hazard map and supporting data. The
flood hazard map shall include, at a minimum, areas of special flood hazard as identified
by the Federal Emergency Management Agency in an engineering report entitled “The
Flood Insurance Study for King County” dated September 2007, as amended or revised
with the accompanying Flood Insurance Rate Map (FIRM) and Flood Boundary and
Floodway Map (FBFM) and related supporting data along with any revisions thereto. The
adopted flood hazard map and supporting data are hereby adopted by reference and
declared to be part of this section.

| (23)(19)Amend IBC Section 1764-141705.15, Exterior insulation and finish systems (EIFS), to
read as follows:

1704-141705.15 Exterior insulation and finish systems (EIFS). Special inspections shall
be required for all EIFS applications. All exterior insulation finish systems (EIFS) shall be
certified by the manufacturer as having been installed per the manufacturer’s
installation recommendations or other agency approved by the building official. The

Page 8 of 17

R:/CC/AAA Ordinances/Ord 583 Bldg & Constr Exhibit B



manufacturer’s certification shall serve as the special inspection requirement when
approved by the building official.

Exception: Special inspections shall not be required for EIFS applications installed
over masonry or concrete walls.

| 1704-14.11705.15.1 Water-resistive barrier coating. A water-resistive barrier coating
complying with ASTM E 2570 requires special inspection of the water-resistive barrier
coating when installed over a sheathing substrate.

| (243(20)Amend IBC Section 2701.1, Scope, to read as follows:

2701.1 Scope. This chapter governs the electrical components, equipment and systems
used in buildings and structures covered by this code. Electrical components, equipment
and systems shall be designed and constructed in accordance with the provisions of the
Burien Electrical Code as adopted in BMC 15.10.140.

(25)(21)Add new IBC section 2702.1.1, Location, to read as follows:

2702.1.2 Location. Location of stationary generators, fuel piping, and storage tanks are
subject to the approval of the building official and/or fire code official.

| {26)(22) (as] Amend IBC Section 3002.4, Elevator car to accommodate ambulance
stretcher, to read as follows:

3002.4 Elevator car to accommodate ambulance stretcher. In buildings four or more

stories above gradeplane-erfourormorestoriesor below grade plane, or in any R1, R2

or | occupancy building provided with an elevator regardless of the number of stories, at

least one elevator shall be provided for fire department emergency access to all floors.

Sueh-The elevator car shall be of such a size and arrangement to accommodate a 24-

inch by 84-inch (610 mm by 2134 mm) ambulance stretcher with not less than 5-inch

(127 mm) radius corners, in the horizontal, open position and shall be identified by the

international symbol for emergency medical services (star of life). The symbol shall not

be less than 3 inches (76 mm) high and shall be placed inside on both sides of the
hoistway door frame.

(273(23)Amend IBC Section 3303, Demolition standards, is amended to read as follows:

3303.1 Purpose. The purpose of this section is to establish standards by which
demolition of existing structures is to be conducted. The proposed standards are
intended to ensure that the public health, safety and welfare are protected when
structures are removed. If demolition is proposed along with an application for a

| construction permit or reuse of a property, sections 3303.5 and 3303.11 do not apply.
Following demolition of any structure the property shall be altered to a condition that
will not create an attractive nuisance or be unsightly to neighboring properties, public
streets and pedestrian facilities. This purpose statement shall be preeminent.

Page 9 of 17

R:/CC/AAA Ordinances/Ord 583 Bldg & Constr Exhibit B



3303.2 Construction Documents. Construction documents and a schedule for
demolition must be submitted when required by the Building Official. Where such
information is required, no work shall be done until such construction documents or
schedule, or both, are approved.

3303.3 Permit Required. A demolition permit is required for any structure to be
removed. The demolition permit may be conditioned as necessary to mitigate adverse
impacts associated with demolition activities and the aesthetic condition of the vacant
site following demolition. All demolition work shall be completed within 30 days from
commencement of demolition activity provided that site restoration work shall be
completed as provided in section 3303.11.

3303.4 Nuisances. The activity shall not create or exacerbate a nuisance as defined by
BMC 8.45.020.

3303.5 Foundation Removal and Surface Restoration. All foundations and/or related
materials shall be removed from the site. Unless otherwise approved by the city, all
man-made or processed surfaces including but not limited to driveways, asphalt, patios
or sidewalks shall be removed, except in the public right-of-way.

3303.6 Pedestrian protection. The work of demolishing any building shall not be
commenced until pedestrian protection is in place as required by this chapter.

3303.7 Means of egress. A party wall balcony or horizontal exit shall not be destroyed
unless and until a substitute means of egress has been provided and approved

3303.8 Vacant Lot. Where a structure has been demolished or removed, the vacant lot
shall be filled and maintained to the existing grade or in accordance with the ordinances
of the jurisdiction having authority. This requirement may be waived if grading would
require the alteration of a critical area and/or its buffer. It may also be waived if grading
activity could result in soil instability.

3303.9 Erosion Control. All areas that have been disturbed by demolition activity shall
be stabilized to prevent erosion. Erosion control measures shall comply with adopted
best management practices and shall be in place prior to and during any demolition
activity.

3303.10 Water Accumulation. Provisions shall be made to prevent the accumulation of
water or damage to any foundations on the premises or the adjoining property.

3303.11 Site Restoration Required. Restoration of properties shall be completed within
4 months of the issuance of a demolition permit. The city may require a financial
guarantee to ensure proper installation, establishment and maintenance of a
restoration plan. Areas of a site that have been disturbed shall be re-vegetated with an
approved hydro-seed mixture.

3303.12 Utility Connections. All service utilities shall be properly capped or terminated
at property lines or at the service connection in the right-of-way unless otherwise
approved by the Building Official. Utilities Removal and/or decommissioning of utilities

Page 10 of 17

R:/CC/AAA Ordinances/Ord 583 Bldg & Constr Exhibit B



shall be completed in accordance with all applicable laws and procedures including but
not limited to the IFC, IBC, WAC and RCW.

‘[AQ] 3303.13 Fire safety during demolition. Fire safety during demolition shall comply
with the applicable requirements of this code and the applicable provisions of Chapter
56 of the International Fire Code.

@8}(2_4)J[A10] Amend IBC Section 3412.2, Applicability as follows: Insert applicable date:

3412.2 Applicability Structures existing prior to July 1, 2648-2013, in which there is work
involving additions, alterations or changes of occupancy shall be made to comply with
the requirements of this section or the provisions of Sections 3403 through 3409. The
provisions in Sections 3412.2.1 through 3412.2.5 shall apply to existing occupancies that
will continue to be, or are proposed to be, in Groups A, B, E, F, M, R, S and U. These
provisions shall not apply to buildings with occupancies in Group H or I.

| {29)(25)IBC Section H104, Identification, is deleted.

15.10.070 \[All]lnternational Residential Code adopted.

The 2009-2012 Edition of the International Residential Code, as published by the
International Code Council Inc. and as adopted by the State Building Code Council in Chapter
51-51 WAC, including Appendix Chapter G, Swimming Pools, Spas and Hot Tubs, WAC 51-51-
60105 - Appendix Chapter R, Dwelling Unit Fire Sprinkler Systems, WAC 51-51-60107 —
Appendix S, Fire Sprinklers, and excluding Chapters 1, 11, 25-43, is hereby adopted by
reference, together with the amendments set forth in this section. The Construction
Administrative Code, as set forth in Chapter 15.05 BMC, shall be used in place of IRC Chapter 1,
Administration.

| (1) Energy Code requirements are regulated by Chapter 53-3151-11R WAC {PASEC)-as
adopted and amended in BMC 15.10.130.

(2) Plumbing Code requirements are regulated by Chapter 51-56 WAC (UPC) as adopted
and amended in BMC 15.10.120.

(3) Electrical Code requirements are regulated by Burien Electrical Code (WCEC) as adopted
in BMC 15.10.140.

| (4) Except where required by the International Fire Code for access or fire flow, an
automatic residential fire sprinkler system shall not be required for additions or alterations to
existing buildings that are not already provided with an automatic residential sprinkler system.

(5) Amend IRC Table R301.2, Climatic and geographic design criteria, to include local design

values as follows:

Page 11 of 17

R:/CC/AAA Ordinances/Ord 583 Bldg & Constr Exhibit B


http://nt5.scbbs.com/cgi-bin/om_isapi.dll?clientID=45239&infobase=wac.sdw&jump=51-51&softpage=PL_Doc#JUMPDEST_51-51

R301.2 Climatic and Geographic design criteria. Buildings shall be constructed in
accordance with the provisions of this code as limited by the provisions of this section.
Additional criteria shall be established by the local jurisdiction and set forth in Table
R301.2 (1). Design values for Table R-301.2(1) shall be as follows:

GROUND AND ROOF SNOW LOAD: 25 PSF
WIND SPEED: 70 mph sustained with 85 mph 3 sec. gust
TOPOGRAPHIC EFFECTS: NetapplieableNo
SEISMIC DESIGN CATEGORY: D2
WEATHERING: Moderate

FROST LINE DEPTH: 12 inches

TERMITE: Slight to moderate

DECAY: Slight to moderate

WINTER DESIGN TEMPERATURE: 24°F.
SUMMER DESIGN TEMPERATURE: 83°F.

ICE SHIELD UNDERLAYMENT REQUIRED: No
FLOOD HAZARDS: See BMC 15.55

AIR FREEZING INDEX: 148°F.- days

MEAN ANNUAL TEMPERATURE: 51.4 °F.
SOIL BEARING (Assumed): 1500 PSF

(6) Amend IRC Appendix S, Fire Sprinklers, to read as follows:

AS107.1 Fire sprinklers. An approved automatic fire sprinkler system shall be installed in
new one-family and two-family dwellings and townhouses in accordance with Appendix R.

EXCEPTION: One -family and two-family dwellings and their attached accessory
structures with a gross floor area less than 3600 square feet.

15.10.080 [a12]international Mechanical code adopted.

The 20092012 Edition of the International Mechanical Code (IMC), as published by the
International Code Council, Inc. and as adopted by the State Building Code Council in Chapter
51-52 WAC, excluding Chapter 1, Administration, is hereby adopted by reference together with
the amendments set forth in this section. The Construction Administrative Code, as set forth in
Chapter 15.05 BMC, shall be used in place of IMC Chapter 1, Administration.

& \[A13]Ameﬂd4M&Seeﬁenégiverxhae%d+sdqa¢ge4&F&adasieHews+

Page 12 of 17

R:/CC/AAA Ordinances/Ord 583 Bldg & Constr Exhibit B



Page 13 of 17

R:/CC/AAA Ordinances/Ord 583 Bldg & Constr Exhibit B



(221) Amend IMC Section 504.4, Exhaust Installation to read as follows:

504.4 Exhaust installation. Dryer exhaust ducts for clothes dryers shall terminate on
the outside of the building and shall be equipped with a back-draft damper. Dryer
exhaust ducts may terminate at approved exterior louvers with not less than 1”
openings in any direction. Screens shall not be installed at the duct termination. Ducts
shall not be connected or installed with sheet metal screws or other fasteners that will
obstruct the exhaust flow. Clothes dryer exhaust ducts shall not be connected to a vent
connector, vent or chimney. Clothes dryer exhaust ducts shall not extend into or
through ducts or plenums.

15.10.090 National Fuel Gas Code (NFPA 54) adopted.

The 2009-2012 Edition of ANSI Z223.1/NFPA 54, National Fuel Gas Code (NFGC), as
published by National Fire Protection Association (NFPA) and as adopted by the State Building
Code Council in Chapter 51-52 WAC, is hereby adopted by reference. The Construction
Administrative Code, as set forth in Chapter 15.05 BMC, shall be used for the administration of
the National Fuel Gas Code.

15.10.100 Liquefied Petroleum Gas Code (NFPA 58) adopted.

The 2008-2011 Edition of NFPA 58, Liquefied Petroleum Gas Code (LPGC), as published
by National Fire Protection Association (NFPA) and as adopted by the State Building Code
Council in Chapter 51-52 WAC, is hereby adopted by reference. The Construction
Administrative Code, as set forth in Chapter 15.05 BMC, shall be used for the administration of
the Liquefied Petroleum Gas Code.

15.10.110 International Fuel Gas Code adopted.

The 20609-2012 Edition of the International Fuel Gas Code (IFGC), as published by the
International Code Council, Inc. and as adopted by the State Building Code Council in Chapter
51-52 WAC, excluding Chapter 1 “Administration”, is hereby adopted by reference together
with the amendments set forth in this section. The Construction Administrative Code, as set
forth in Chapter 15.05 BMC, shall be used in place of IFGC Chapter 1, Administration.

Page 14 of 17

R:/CC/AAA Ordinances/Ord 583 Bldg & Constr Exhibit B



(1) Amend IFGC Section 614.4, Exhaust installation to read as follows:

614.4 Exhaust installation. Exhaust ducts for clothes dryers shall terminate on the
outside of the building and shall be equipped with a back-draft damper. Dryer exhaust
ducts may terminate at approved exterior louvers with not less than 1” openings in any
direction. Screens shall not be installed at the duct termination. Ducts shall not be
connected or installed with sheet metal screws or other fasteners that will obstruct the
flow. Clothes dryer exhaust ducts shall not be connected to a vent connector, vent or
chimney. Clothes dryer exhaust ducts shall not extend into or through ducts or plenums.

15.10.120 [A14]Uniform Plumbing Code adopted.

The 2009-2012 Edition of the Uniform Plumbing Code (UPC), as published by the
International Association of Plumbing and Mechanical Officials and as adopted and amended by
the State Building Code Council in Chapters 51-56 and-53-572-WAC, including Appendix A —
Recommended Rules for Sizing the Water Supply System; Appendix B — Explanatory Notes on
Combination Waste and Vent Systems; Appendix | — Installation Standards. In addition, and
Appendix £C Alternate Plumbing Systems, excluding Sections £5-C5 through £7-C7 of Appendix
C is hereby adopted by reference together with the additions, deletions, exceptions, and
amendments set forth in this section. The Construction Administrative Code, as set forth in
Chapter 15.05 BMC, shall be used in place of UPC Chapter 1, Administration; Chapters 12 and
15 of the Uniform Plumbing Code are not adopted; and, Those requirements of the Uniform
Plumbing Code relating to venting and combustion air of fuel-fired appliances as found in
Chapter 5 and those portions of the code addressing building sewers as identified in WAC 51-56
are not adopted.

(1) Amend UPC Section 342:0311.0 Independent Systems as follows:

312.0311.0 Independent Systems. The drainage system of each new building and of
new work installed in any existing building shall be separate and independent from that
of any other building, and, when available, every building shall have an independent
connection with a public or private sewer.

Exception: Where one (1) building stands in the rear of another building on an
interior lot, and no private sewer is available or can be constructed to the rear
building through an adjoining court, yard, or driveway, the building drain from
the front building shall be permitted to be extended to the rear building.

Swimming pools shall be provided with a separate and independent drainage
system, which shall connect with a public or private sewer. The drainage pipe for the
pool, floor drain, and similar fixtures shall be connected either to the side sewer
downstream of the main building or structure, or to the building sewer downstream of
the last plumbing fixture. The main building drain shall be equipped with an accessible
backwater valve outside of the building or structure and upstream of the pool drain
connection.

Page 15 of 17

R:/CC/AAA Ordinances/Ord 583 Bldg & Constr Exhibit B



| (2)

Amend UPC chapter 6, table 6-5610.3, Water Supply Fixture Units (WSFU) and Minimum

Fixture Branch Pipe Sizes, as follows:

(3)

(4)

(1)

Delete “Lawn Sprinkler, each head” “for “Private Use” from the table.

Amend UPC section 708.0 Grade of Horizontal Drainage Piping to read as follows:

708.0 Grade of Horizontal Drainage Piping. Horizontal drainage piping shall be run in
practical alignment and a uniform slope of not less than one fourth (1/4) inch per foot
(20.9 mm/m) or two (2) percent toward the point of disposal provided that, where it is
impractical due to the depth of the street sewer or to the structural features or to the
arrangement of any building or structure to obtain a slope of one-fourth (1/4) of an inch
per foot (20.9 mm/m) or two (2) percent. Any such pipe or piping four (4) inches (100
mm) or larger in diameter may have a slope of not less than one-eighth (1/8) of an inch
per foot (10.5 mm/m) or one (1) percent, only when first approved by the building
official. Horizontal drainage piping connected to any dual flush gravity tank water closet
shall slope a minimum of one -fourth (1/4) inch per foot.

Amend UPC Section 4301-11.:2.2.21101.11.2.2(B), Combined System, to read as follows:

110111222 1101.11.2.2(B) Combined System. The secondary roof drains shall
connect to the vertical piping of the primary storm drainage system conductor
downstream of any horizontal offset below the roof. The primary storm drainage system
shall connect to the building storm water that connects to an underground public storm
sewer. The combined secondary and primary roof drain systems shall be sized in
accordance with Section 1106.0 based on double the rainfall for the local area. A relief
drain shall be connected to the vertical drain piping, within 20 feet of grade, using a
wye-type fitting piped to daylight on the exterior of the building. The piping shall be
sized as required for a secondary drain with a 4 inch maximum.

15.10.130 Washington-State-International Energy Conservation Code adopted.

The Washington-State-Energy-CodeWSEC)HInternational Energy Conservation Code, as

adopted by the State Building Code Council in Chapters 53-41-51-11A, 51-11C, and 51-11R
WAC, is hereby adopted by reference. The Construction Administrative Code, as set forth in
Chapter 15.05 BMC, shall be used for the administration of the Washington State Energy Code.

Sections R107, Fees; R108, Stop Work Order: R109, Board of appeals; R110, Violations;

and R111, Liability are not adopted.

(2)

Sections C107, Fees; C108, Stop Work Order; C109, Board of appeals; C110, Violations;

and C111, Liability are not adopted.

15.10.140 Washington Cities Electrical Code adopted

Page 16 of 17

R:/CC/AAA Ordinances/Ord 583 Bldg & Constr Exhibit B



(1) The November 12, 2009 edition of the Washington Cities Electrical Code (WCEC), Parts
one and three, as published by the Washington Association of Building Officials is
hereby adopted by reference and shall be known as the Burien Electrical Code.

2 The “Construction Administrative Code” as set forth in BMC 15.05 shall be used for the
administration of the Burien Electrical Code.

(3) Conflicts.

(a) The requirements of this chapter will be observed where there is any conflict between
this chapter and the National Electrical Code (NFPA 70), Centrifugal Fire Pumps (NFPA
20), the Emergency and Standby Power Systems (NFPA 110), ANSI/TIA/EIA 568-B,
ANSI/TIA/EIA 569-A, ANSI/TIA/EIA 607, or ANSI/TIA/EIA 570.

(b) The National Electrical Code will be followed when there is any conflict between
standard for Installation of Stationary Pumps for Fire Protection (NFPA 20), standard for
Emergency and Standby Power Systems (NFPA 110), ANSI/TIA/EIA 568-B, ANSI/TIA/EIA
569-A, ANSI/TIA/EIA 607, ANSI/TIA/EIA 570-B, and the National Electrical Code (NFPA
70).

(c) Inaccordance with RCW 19.28.010(3), when the State of Washington, Department of
Labor and Industries adopts a more current edition of the National Electrical Code
(NFPA 70), the building official may supplement use of the Burien Electrical Code with
newly adopted editions of the National Electrical Code. Provisions in the annex chapters
of the National Electrical Code shall not apply unless specifically referenced in the
adopting ordinance.

Page 17 of 17

R:/CC/AAA Ordinances/Ord 583 Bldg & Constr Exhibit B



Exhibit C

| Chapter 15.20
Sections:
15.20.010

15.20.020
15.20.030
15.20.040
15.20.050
15.20.060
15.20.070
15.20.080
15.20.090
15.20.100
15.20.110
15.20.120
15.20.130
15.20.140
15.20.150
15.20.160
15.20.170
15.20.180
15.20.190

| 15.20.200

| 15.20.210

| 15.20.220
| 15.20.230

1526240

FIRE CODE

Short title.

Adoption of International Fire Code.

Section 104 - Amended - General authority and responsibility.

Section 105 amended - Permits.

Section 108 amended - Board of appeals.

Section 109 amended - Violations.

Section 111 amended - Stop work order.

Section 113 amended - Fees.

Section 308.3 amended - Group A occupancies - Exceptions.

Section 314.4 amended - Indoor displays - Vehicles.

Section 503 amended - Fire apparatus access roads.

Section 506 amended - Key boxes - Where required.

Section 507 amended - Fire protection water supplies.

Section 508.1 amended - Fire command center - Penetrations.

Section 602 amended - Building services and systems - Definitions.
Section 604 - Emergency and standby power systems - High rise buildings.
Section 901 amended - Fire protection systems.

Section 903.2 amended - Automatic sprinkler systems - Where required.
Section 907 amended - Fire alarm and detection systems.

Section 3404-2.9:6-15704.2 amended - Flammable and combustible liquids -
Storage.

Section 3406-2:4-45706.2.4.4 amended — Special operations — Storage and
dispensing of flammable and combustible liquids on farms and construction
sites - Locations where above-ground tanks are prohibited.

Section 3506-25806.2 amended — Flammable Cryogenic Fluids — Limitations.

Section 3804-26104.2 amended - Location of LP-Gas Containers - Maximum
capacity within established limits.




15.20.010 Short title.
This chapter shall be known as and may be referred to as the “city of Burien Fire Code.”

15.20.020 Adoption of International Fire Code.

The 20092012 Edition of the International Fire Code (IFC) as published by the
International Code Council, Inc. and as adopted by the State Building Code Council in Chapter
51-5451-54A WAC, and including Appendix B (Fire-Flow Requirements for Buildings), Appendix
C (Fire Hydrant Locations and Distribution), Appendix D (Fire Apparatus Access Roads, and
Appendix H (Hazardous Materials Management Plan (HMMP) and Hazardous Materials
Inventory Statement (HMIS) Instructions a-nel—)A-ppeﬂéaé[A1]4—(-Emngeﬂey—Respeﬂde¥—Rad+e
Coverage}, is hereby adopted by reference, together with the amendments, additions,
deletions, and exception as set forth in this chapter.

15.20.030 Section 104 amended — General authority and responsibility.
(1) IFC Section 104.10.1, Assistance from other agencies, is amended to read as follows:

104.10.1 Assistance from other agencies. Police and other enforcement agencies shall
have authority to render necessary assistance in the investigation of fires or the
enforcement of this code when requested to do so by the fire code official.

(2) IFC Section 104.11.2, Obstructing operations, is amended to read as follows:

104.11.2 Obstructing operations. No person shall obstruct the operations of the fire
department in connection with extinguishment, control, or investigation of any fire, or
actions relative to other emergencies, or disobey any lawful command of the fire chief
or officer of the fire department in charge of the emergency, or any part thereof, or any
lawful order of a police officer assisting the fire department.

15.20.040 Section 105 amended — Permits
(1) IFC Section 105.2.3, Time limitation of application, is amended to read as follows:

105.2.3 Time limitation of application. An application for any operational permit shall
be deemed to have been abandoned 180 days after the date of filing, unless such
application has been diligently prosecuted or a permit shall have been issued; except
that the fire code official is authorized to grant one or more extensions of time for
additional periods not exceeding 90 days each. The extension shall be requested in
writing and justifiable cause demonstrated.

An application for any fire protection systems construction permit shall be
subject to the time limitations as prescribed in BMC 15.05.280.

(2) IFC Section 105.3.1, Expiration, is amended to read as follows:

105.3.1 Expiration. An operational permit shall remain in effect until reissued, renewed,
or revoked or for such a period of time as specified in the permit. Fire protection

Page 2 of 12

R:/CC/AAA Ordinances/Ord 583 Bldg & Constr Exhibit C



systems construction permits expiration shall be as prescribed in BMC 15.05.290.
Permits are not transferable and any change in occupancy, operation, tenancy or
ownership shall require that a new permit be issued.

(3) IFC Section 105.3.2, Extensions, is amended to read as follows:

105.3.2 Extensions. A permittee holding an unexpired operational permit shall have the
right to apply for an extension of the time within which the permittee will commence
work under that permit when work is unable to be commenced within the time required
by this section for good and satisfactory reasons. The fire code official is authorized to
grant, in writing, one or more extensions of the time period of a permit for periods of
not more than 180 days each. Such extensions shall be requested by the permit holder
in writing and justifiable cause demonstrated.

Fire protection systems construction permits may be extended or renewed in
accordance with BMC 15.05.295.

15.20.050 Section 108 amended — Board of appeals.
(2) IFC Section 108, Board of Appeals, is not adopted and is replaced as follows:

Section 108 — Means of appeal
108.1 General. Appeals shall be heard by the Hearing Examiner pursuant to BMC
15.05.400.

15.20.060 Section 109 amended — Violations.
(2) IFC Section 109.1, Unlawful acts, is amended to read as follows:

Section 109.1 Unlawful acts. It shall be unlawful for any person, firm or corporation to
erect, construct, alter, extend, repair, move, remove, demolish or utilize a any building,
occupancy, premises, structure, property, equipment, or system regulated by this code,
or cause same to be done, in conflict with or in violation of any of the provisions of this
code. Signs, tags or seals posted or affixed by the code official shall not be mutilated,
destroyed or tampered with or removed without authorization from the code official.

(2) IFC Section 109.2, Notice of violation, is amended to read as follows:

Section 109.2 Violation enforcement. Violations shall be enforced as prescribed in BMC
15.05.410.

(3) IFC Section 109.3, Violation penalties, is amended to read as follows:

Section 109.3 Violation penalties. Violation penalties shall be as prescribed in BMC
15.05.410.

15.20.070 Section 111 amended — Stop work order.
(1) IFC Section 111.4, Failure to comply, is amended to read as follows:

111.4 Failure to comply. Any person who shall continue any work after having been
served with a stop work order, except such work as that person is directed to perform to

Page 3 of 12

R:/CC/AAA Ordinances/Ord 583 Bldg & Constr Exhibit C



remove a violation or unsafe condition, shall be subject to the effects and penalties in
BMC 15.05.415 (3) and (4).

15.20.080 Section 113 amended - Fees.
(1) IFC Section 113.2, Schedule of permit fees, is amended to read as follows:

113.2 Schedule of permit fees. A fee for each permit shall be paid as required in
accordance with the city’s contract with King County Fire District #2 and BMC 15.05.375
(2). Plan Review fees shall be in accordance with BMC 15.05.375 (3). Permit Valuations
shall be determined in accordance with BMC 15.05.375 (4).

(2) IFC Section 113.3, Work commencing before permit issuance, is amended to read as
follows:

113.3 Work commencing before permit issuance. Any person who commences any
work, activity or operation regulated by this code before obtaining the necessary
permits shall be subject to the penalties and requirements of BMC 15.05.375 (5).

(3) IFC Section 113.5, Refunds, is amended to read as follows:

113.5 Refunds. Refunds may be authorized by the building official in accordance with
BMC 15.05.375 (7).

15.20.090 Section 308.3 amended — Group A occupancies — Exceptions.
(2) IFC Section 308.3, Group A occupancies — Exceptions is amended by addition of a fourth
exception to read as follows:

4. Where approved by the fire code official (see also Section 308.1.8).

15.20.100 Section 314.4 amended — Indoor displays — Vehicles.
(2) IFC Section 314.4, Vehicles, is amended as follows:

314.4 Vehicles. Liquid- or gas-fueled vehicles, fueled equipment, boats or other
motorcraft shall not be located indoors except as follows:
1. Batteries are disconnected.
2. Fuelin fuel tanks does not exceed one-quarter tank or 5 gallons (19L) (whichever
is least).
Fuel tanks and fill openings are closed and sealed to prevent tampering.
4. Vehicles, boats or other motorcraft equipment are not fueled or defueled within
the building.

w

15.20.110 Section 503 amended — Fire apparatus access roads.

The city of Burien does not adopt WAC 51-54-0500 and does adopt the following
sections and their subsections of the International Fire Code, as adopted by this chapter:
(1) IFC Section 503.1, Where required, as written in the IFC is adopted without
amendments.

Page 4 of 12

R:/CC/AAA Ordinances/Ord 583 Bldg & Constr Exhibit C



(2)

IFC Section 503.2, Specifications, as written in the IFC is adopted without amendment,

except IFC section 503.2.2, Authority, is amended as follows:

(3)

503.2.2 Authority. The fire code official shall have the authority to allow a decrease in
minimum access widths or require an increase in minimum access widths where they
are inadequate for fire or rescue operations.

IFC Section 503.3, Marking, is amended to read as follows:

503.3 Marking. Where required by the fire code official, approved signs or other
approved notices shall be provided for fire apparatus access roads to identify such roads
or prohibit the obstruction thereof.

Signs or notices shall be maintained in a clean and legible condition at all times
and shall be replaced or repaired when necessary to provide adequate visibility. Marked
fire apparatus access roads, or “fire lanes” as defined above may be established or
relocated at the time of plan review, pre-construction site inspection, and/or post
construction site inspection as well as any time during the life of the occupancy as
needed to provide and maintain fire department access. The fire code official or his/her
designee may require that areas specified for use as driveways or private thoroughfares
shall be designated as fire lanes and be marked or identified as required by this Section.
All designated fire lanes shall be clearly marked in the following manner:

(a) Vertical curbs (6 inch) shall be painted yellow on the top and side, extending
the length of the designated fire lane. The pavement adjacent to the painted
curbs shall be marked with minimum 18 inch in height block lettering with a
minimum 3 inch brush stroke reading: “NO PARKING - FIRE LANE.” Lettering shall
be yellow and spaced at 50 foot intervals or portions thereof, or

(b) Rolled curbs or surfaces without curbs shall have a yellow 6 inch wide stripe
painted extending the length of the designated fire lane. The surface adjacent to
the stripe shall be marked with minimum 18 inch in height block lettering with a
minimum 3 inch brush stroke reading: “NO PARKING — FIRE LANE.” Lettering shall
be in yellow and spaced at 50 foot intervals or portions thereof, or

(c) Curbs shall be painted and/or surfaces striped as noted above and fire lane
signs shall be installed as follows:

1’0” min. width

- NO 3-inch height

-

.og

T PARKING 3-inch height

c

IS

)

— FIRE 2- inch height
LANE 2-inch height

Page 5 of 12

R:/CC/AAA Ordinances/Ord 583 Bldg & Constr Exhibit C



(4)

(i) Reflective in nature.
(ii) Red letters on white background.

(iii) Signs shall be spaced at 50 foot intervals or portions thereof apart and
posted on or immediately next to the curb.

(iv) Top of signs shall be not less than 4 feet or more than 6 feet from the
ground.

(v) Signs may be placed on a building when approved by the fire code official.

(vi) When posts are required they shall be a minimum of 2 inch galvanized steel
or 4 inch x 4 inch pressure treated wood. Signs shall be placed so they face
the direction of the vehicular travel.

(d) Diagonal yellow striping across the width of the Fire Lane shall be used when
required by the fire code official. They shall be used in conjunction with a 6 inch yellow
stripe and lettering indicated in item #2-“b”. They shall run at a 30 to 60 degree angle
and shall be parallel with each other. The stripes shall be a minimum of 6 inches in width
and a minimum of 24 inches apart.

IFC Section 503.4, Obstruction of fire apparatus roads, is amended to read as follows:

503.4 Obstruction of fire apparatus roads/fire lanes. Fire apparatus access
roads/fire lanes shall not be obstructed in any manner, including the parking of
vehicles. The minimum widths and clearances established in Section 503.2.1 shall
be maintained at all times.

(a) The obstruction of a designated fire lane by a parked vehicle or any other
object is prohibited and shall constitute a traffic and fire hazard and be deemed
an immediate hazard to life and property.

(b) No person shall stop, stand, or park a vehicle whether occupied or not within
a designated Fire Lane, except; momentarily to pick up or discharge a passenger
or passengers provided the driver does not leave the vehicle.

(c) No person shall allow continued violations of this section on private property
which they own or manage.

(d) Any vehicle or object obstructing a designated fire lane is hereby declared a
traffic and fire hazard and may be immediately impounded pursuant to
applicable state law, without prior notification to its owner. Pursuant to state
law, the owner may be held responsible for all impound fees.

(e) The owner, manager, or person in charge of any property upon which
designated fire lanes have been established shall provide marking as required
above and, shall prevent the parking of vehicles or placement of other
obstructions in such fire lanes.

Page 6 of 12

R:/CC/AAA Ordinances/Ord 583 Bldg & Constr Exhibit C



(f) Fire lane markings shall be maintained at the expense of the property
owner(s) as often as needed to clearly identify the designated area as being a
fire lane.

(g) Parking control officers, as defined in BMC 10.15.120, are authorized to issue
notices of traffic infraction for violations of this section in accordance with BMC
10.15.120. Such notices also may be issued by any police officer.

(h) Penalties for infractions of this section shall be in accordance with BMC
10.15.140.

(i) Each day or part of a day during which the unlawful act or violation occurs
shall constitute a separate offense.

15.20.120 Section 506 amended — Key boxes — Where required.

(1)

IFC Section 506.1, Where required, is amended by the addition of a second paragraph

and exception as follows:

506.1 Where required. Where access to or within a structure or an area is restricted
because of secured openings or where immediate access is necessary for life-saving or
fire-fighting purposes, the fire code official is authorized to require a key box to be
installed in an approved location. The key box shall be of an approved type listed in
accordance with UL 1037ja2] and shall contain keys to gain necessary access as required
by the fire code official.

All occupancies equipped with an automatic sprinkler system or fire alarm
system shall have a key box mounted in a location approved by the fire code official.

Exception: One and two family dwelling.

15.20.130 Section 507 amended — Fire protection water supplies.

(1)

IFC Section 507.1, Required water supply, is amended by the addition of the following

paragraph:

(2)

507.1 Required water supply. An approved water supply capable of supplying the
required fire flow for fire protection shall be provided to premises upon which facilities,
buildings or portions of buildings are hereafter constructed or moved into or within the
jurisdiction.

The type of hydrants shall be approved by the building official, fire chief, and the
water purveyor. Existing substandard water supply mains and/or hydrant installations,
which serve new constructions, shall be upgraded. Fire hydrants and their supplying
mains shall be installed to the standard of the water purveyor and shall be dedicated
along with repair easements, where needed, to the purveyor. This section shall not
apply to conditions existing prior to the effective date of this chapter.

IFC Section 507.3, Fire Flow, is amended to read as follows:

Page 7 of 12

R:/CC/AAA Ordinances/Ord 583 Bldg & Constr Exhibit C



(3)

507.3 Fire flow. Fire flow requirements for buildings or portions of buildings and

facilities shall be determined by use of Appendix B.
Exception: Fire flow is not required for structure under 500 square feet with a B,
U or R-1 occupancy where structures are at least 30 fee from any other structure
and are used only for recreation

IFC Section 507.5.1, Where required, is amended to read as follows:

507.5.1 Where required. Where a portion of the facility or building hereafter
constructed or moved into or within the jurisdiction is more than 150 feet from a
hydrant on a fire apparatus access road, as measured by an approved route around the
exterior of the facility or building, on-site fire hydrants and mains shall be provided
where required by the fire code official. Fire hydrant locations and distribution shall be
in accordance with Appendix C.

Exceptions:

1. For Group R-3 and Group U occupancies, the distance requirement shall be

350 feet.

2. For Group R-3 and Group U occupancies equipped throughout with an

approved automatic sprinkler system the distance requirement may be modified

by the fire code official.

[Ord. 408 & 1, 2004]

15.20.140 Section 508.1 amended - Fire command center — Penetrations.

(1)

IFC Section 508.1, General, is amended by the addition of a new subsection 508.1.6,

Penetrations, to read as follows:

508.1.6 Penetrations. Penetrations into and openings through a fire command center
are prohibited except for required exit doors, equipment and ductwork necessary for
heating, cooling or ventilation, sprinkler branch line piping, electrical raceway for fire
department communication and control and electrical raceway serving the fire
command center or being controlled from the fire command center. Such penetrations
shall be protected in accordance with Section P—13—714 [A3jof the International Building
Code.
Exception: Metallic piping with no joints or openings.

15.20.150 Section 602 amended — Building services and systems — Definitions.

(1)

IFC Section 602.1, Definitions, is amended by addition of the following:

POWER TAP. A listed device for indoor use consisting of an attachment plug on
one end of a flexible cord and two or more receptacles on the opposite end, and
has overcurrent protection.

15.20.160 Section 604.2.14 amended - Emergency and standby power systems — High rise

(1)

buildings.

IFC Section 604.2.14, High-rise buildings, is amended to include new subsection

602.14.1.4, Penetrations as follows:

Page 8 of 12

R:/CC/AAA Ordinances/Ord 583 Bldg & Constr Exhibit C



604.2.14 High-rise buildings. Standby power, light and emergency systems in high-rise
buildings shall comply with the requirements of Sections 604.2.14.1 through 604.2.14.4.

604.2.14.1.4 Penetrations. Penetrations into and openings through a room containing a
standby power system are prohibited except for required exit doors, equipment and
ductwork necessary for heating, cooling or ventilation, sprinkler branch line piping, or
electrical raceway serving the standby power system or being controlled by the standby
power system. Such penetrations shall be protected in accordance with Section P—l—ﬂ[M]
714 of the International Building Code.

Exception: Metallic piping with no joints or openings where it passes through
the standby power system room.

| 15.20.170 Section 901 amended - Fire protection systems.

(1)

IFC Section 901.4, Installation, is amended by the addition of a new subsection

| 9014-4-5901.4.7[a5] Additions, change of use, alterations and repairs to buildings, to read as
follows:

(2)

901.4.5901.4.7 Additions, change of use, alterations and repairs to buildings.
Additions, change of use, alterations and repairs to buildings shall comply with Chapter
34 of the International Building Code.

IFC Section 901.7, Systems out of service is amended to read as follows:

901.7 Systems out of service. Where a fire protection system is out of service, the fire
department and the fire code official shall be notified immediately and, where required
by the fire code official, the building shall either be evacuated or an approved fire watch
shall be provided for all occupants left unprotected by the shut down until the fire
protection system has been returned to service.

Where utilized, fire watches shall be provided with at least one approved means
for notification of the fire department and their only duty shall be to perform constant
patrols of the protected premises and keep watch for fires.

| 15.20.180 Section 903.2 amended — Automatic sprinkler systems — Where required.

(1)

IFC Section 903.2, Where required, is amended to read as follows:

903.2 Where required. Approved automatic sprinkler systems in new buildings and
structures shall be provided in the locations described in Sections 903.2.1 through
903.2.12, WAC 51-50-903, and in all buildings with a gross area of 5,000 square feet or
greater, regardless of type or use.
Exceptions: Spaces or areas in telecommunications buildings used exclusively
for telecommunications equipment, associated electrical power distribution
equipment, batteries and standby engines, provided those spaces or areas are
equipped throughout with an automatic smoke detection system in accordance
with Section 907.2 and are separated from the remainder of the building by not

Page 9 of 12

R:/CC/AAA Ordinances/Ord 583 Bldg & Constr Exhibit C



less than 1-hour fire barriers constructed in accordance with IBC Section 707 Fire
Barriers or not less than 2-hour horizontal assemblies constructed in accordance
with IBC Section 742711 Horizontal Assemblies, or both.

For the purposes of this section, fire walls as specified in Section706 of the
International Building Code shall not be used to reduce the calculation of floor areas of
this chapter.

15.20.190 Section 907 amended - Fire alarm and detection systems.

(1)

(2)

(3)

IFC Section 907.1.3, Equipment, is amended to read as follows:

907.1.3 Equipment. Systems and their components shall be listed and approved for the
purpose for which they are installed. All new alarm systems shall be addressable. Each
device shall have its own address and shall annunciate individual addresses at the
approved supervising station.

IFC Section 907.2, System installation, is amended by addition of the following section:
907.2.24 System installation. Fire alarm systems shall be installed and maintained in
accordance with this code by persons under the direct supervision of individuals that
have factory training and certification on the system being installed. Plans submitted for
Fire Alarm System permits shall be prepared under the supervision of individuals
possessing a NICET (National Institute for Certification in Engineering Technologies)
Level Il certification in Fire Alarm Systems; or shall be licensed by the State of
Washington as a Professional Fire Protection or Electrical Engineer or certified by the
State of Washington. Plans shall identify certification and/or licensing information.

IFC Section 907:9:5907.8.5[a6], Maintenance, inspection and testing, is amended by

addition of a second paragraph to read as follows:

907.9.5907.8.5 Maintenance, inspection and testing. The building owner shall be
responsible to maintain the fire and life safety systems in an operable condition at all
times. Service personnel shall meet the qualification requirements of NFPA 72 for
maintaining, inspecting and testing such systems. A written record shall be maintained
and shall be made available to the fire code official.

It shall be the responsibility of an owner of the apartment building, upon every
change in tenancy of a dwelling unit, to inspect the fire warning system within such
dwelling unit to determine if the same is in operating condition. If the same is not in
operating condition, the owner shall repair or replace the same and shall not allow
occupancy of such dwelling unit until the fire warning system therein is operating
properly. During the term of any tenancy of a dwelling unit in an apartment building, it
shall be the responsibility of the tenant, and not the owner, to maintain the fire warning
system therein in operating condition.

15.20.200 Section 3404-25704.2/A71 amended - Flammable and combustible liquids -
Storage.

(1)

IFC Section 34042933 5704.2.9.6.1, Locations where above-ground tanks are

prohibited, is amended to read as follows:

Page 10 of 12

R:/CC/AAA Ordinances/Ord 583 Bldg & Constr Exhibit C



3404.2.9.6-15704.2.9.6.1 Locations where above-ground tanks are regulated. Storage
of Class | and Il liquids in above-ground tanks outside of buildings is subject to the
requirements of Chapter 19.40 BMC — “Critical Areas.”

(2)  IFC Section 3494.—1—]:2—5704.2.11.’2“%8], Locations, is amended to read as follows:

3404-2.11.25704.2.11.2 Location. Flammable and combustible liquid storage tanks
located underground, either outside or under buildings, shall be in accordance with all
of the following:

1. Tanks shall be located with respect to existing foundations and supports such that the
loads carried by the latter cannot be transmitted to the tank.

2. The distance from any part of a tank storing liquids to the nearest wall of a basement,
pit, cellar, or lot line shall not be less than 3 feet (914 mm).

3. A minimum distance of 1 foot (305 mm), shell to shell, shall be maintained between
underground tanks.

4. Tank location shall be in accordance with the limitations of Chapter 19.40 BMC -
“Critical areas”.

15.20.‘210‘[A9] Section 3406-2:4-45706.2.4.4 amended — Special operations — Storage and
dispensing of flammable and combustible liquids on farms and construction sites - Locations
where above-ground tanks are prohibited.
(1) IFC Section 3406-2-4-45706.2.4.4, Locations were above ground tanks are prohibited, is
amended to read as follows:
3406-2:4-45706.2.4.4 Locations where above-ground tanks are prehibited regulated.
The storage of Class | and Il liquids in above-ground tanks is subject to the requirements
of Chapter 19.40 BMC — “Critical Areas.”

15.20.220[A10] Section 3506-25806.2 amended — Flammable Cryogenic Fluids — Limitations.
(1) IFC Section 3506-25806.2, Limitations, is amended to read as follows:

3506-25806.2 Limitations. Storage of flammable cryogenic fluids in stationary
containers outside of buildings is subject to the requirements of Chapter 19.40 BMC —
“Critical Areas.”

15.20.\230\[A11] Section 3804-26104.2 amended - Location of LP-Gas Containers - Maximum
capacity within established limits.

(2) IFC Section 3804-26104.2, Maximum capacity within established limits, is amended to
read as follows:

3804.26104.2 Maximum capacity within established limits. The aggregate capacity for
the storage of Liquid Petroleum Gas (LPG) of any one installation shall not exceed 2,000
gallons water capacity, except that in particular installations this capacity limit may be
altered at the discretion of the fire code official after consideration of special features
such as topographical conditions, nature of the occupancy and proximity to buildings,

Page 11 of 12

R:/CC/AAA Ordinances/Ord 583 Bldg & Constr Exhibit C



capacity of proposed tanks, degree of private fire protection to be provided, and
facilities of the fire department.

Page 12 of 12

R:/CC/AAA Ordinances/Ord 583 Bldg & Constr Exhibit C



